

Black & White Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	10 - 14 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	2,000	AAIS MAT#	10119110
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 203

Counties to be covered at this price:
 Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan
 Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order: 15 **Days**

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost (CPC)
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 203 w/ stand 120/150	
Features	Single paper source (250 sheets minimum)	included	\$0.02090000
	plus a Bypass tray	included	
	Manual Document Feed	included	Overage
	Photo Mode	included	\$0.015675
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (minimum)	included	
Originals	8 1/2" X 14"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 8 1/2" X 14"	included	
Resolution	400 X 400dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Not Required	included	
Memory	4 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation	Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting	Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
ADF	Automatic Document Feeder	MR2018	\$0.00480000
Cassette	2nd 250 sheet cassette	MY1034	\$0.00330000

Black & White Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	15-19 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	4,000	AAIS MAT#	10119111
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 255

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost (CPC)
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 255 w/ stand 120/150	
Features	Single paper source (250 sheets minimum)	included	\$0.01640000
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	ADF	MR2018	Overage
	Photo Mode	included	\$0.012300
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (minimum)	included	
Originals	To 8 1/2" X 14"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 8 1/2" X 14"	included	
Resolution	400 X 400dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-200% zoom w/presets	included	
Memory	6 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Cassette	2nd 250 sheet cassette	MY1034	\$0.00160000

Black & White Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	20 - 24 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	7,500	AAIS MAT#	10119112
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 255

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan
Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order: 15 Days

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost (CPC)
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 255 w/ stand 3511/4511	Overage \$0.012675
Features	Two paper sources (500 sheets minimum)	included	
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	ADF	MR3021	
	Auto 2:2 duplex	included	
	Photo Mode	included	
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (Minimum)	included	
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	
	Book Copy	included	
	2-in-1	included	
	Job Programs	included	
	10BS or Electronic sorting	included	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	400 X 400dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-200% Zoom w/presets	included	
Memory	8 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation	Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting	Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Hanging Finisher	Single position stapling finisher	MJ1031	\$0.00290000
Saddle Stitch Finisher	Saddle Stitch Finisher	MJ1025	\$0.00520000
Job Separator	Separates copy, fax, print jobs	MJ5004	\$0.00110000
Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch	MJ6005	\$0.00110000
Paper Feed Pedestal	3rd 550 sheet paper cassette	KD1025	\$0.00190000
Cassette for KD1011	4th 550 sheet paper cassette (requires KD1011)	MY1033	\$0.00110000
Large Capacity Feeder	2500 sheet LCF	KD1026	\$0.00230000
Printer Kit	Network Printing	GM1020	\$0.00600000
Printer / Scanner Kit	Network Printing and Scanning	GM2020	\$0.01100000
Scanner Upgrade Kit	Adds scanning to GM1020	GM3020	\$0.00270000
Fax Board	Allows walk-up Fax	GD1250	\$0.00330000
2nd Fax Line	2nd Fax Line	GD1260	\$0.00210000

Black & White Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	25 - 29 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	10,000	AAIS MAT#	10119113
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 305

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order: 15 **Days**

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost (CPC)
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 305	
Features	Two paper sources (1,500 sheets minimum)	PFP KD1025	\$0.01840000
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	ADF	MR3021	Overage
	Auto 2:2 duplex,	included	\$0.013800
	Photo Mode	included	
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (Minimum)	included	
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	
	book copy	included	
	2-in-1	included	
	job programs	included	
	finisher 1000/20/1	MJ1025	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	400 X 400dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-200% Zoom w/presets	included	
Memory	12 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Job Separator	Separates copy, fax, print jobs	MJ5004	\$0.00090000
Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch	MJ6005	\$0.00070000
Cassette for KD1011	4th 550 sheet paper cassette (requires KD1011)	MY1033	\$0.00080000
Large Capacity Feeder	2500 sheet LCF	KD1012	\$0.00180000
Printer Kit	Network Printing	GM1020	\$0.00500000
Printer / Scanner Kit	Network Printing and Scanning	GM2020	\$0.00900000
Scanner Upgrade Kit	Adds scanning to GM1020	GM3020	\$0.00200000
Fax Board	Allows walk-up Fax	GD1250	\$0.00250000
2nd Fax Line	2nd Fax Line	GD1260	\$0.00160000

Black & White Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	30 - 34 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	20,000	AAIS MAT#	10119114
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 355

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan
Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order: 15 **Days**

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 354	Overage \$0.008925
Features	Three paper sources (3,000 sheets min.)	LCF KD1026	
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	RADF	MR3022	
	Auto 2:2 Duplex	included	
	Photo Mode	included	
	Book Copy	included	
	Job Programs	included	
	2-in-1	included	
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (min.)	included	
	Finisher 1000/30/1	MJ1101	
	Copy Control/Elec. Auditron (10 accounts min.)	included	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	600 X 600dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-200% zoom w/presets	included	
Memory	16 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation	Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting	Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Saddle Stitch Finisher	Saddle Stitch Finisher	MJ1024	\$0.00290000
Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch	MJ 6004	\$0.00060000
Work Tray	Provides work surface on Copier	KK4550	\$0.00010000
Print Enabler	Network Printing	GM1010	\$0.00420000
Print /Scan Enabler	Network Printing and Scanning	GM2010	\$0.00750000
Scan Upgrade Enabler	Adds scanning to GM1010	GM3010	\$0.00140000
Wireless LAN Adapter	Wireless Network Print and Scan for GM1010 or GM2010	GN1050	\$0.00130000
Fax Board	Allows walk-up Fax	GD1250	\$0.00120000
Scrambler Board	Hard Drive Eraser	GP1080	\$0.00160000
Data Overwrite	Data Overwrite	GP1050	\$0.00100000

Black & White Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	35 - 39 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	30,000	AAIS MAT#	10119115
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 355

Counties to be covered at this price:
 Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 355	
Features	Three paper sources (3,000 sheets min.)	LCF KD1026	\$0.00890000
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	RADF	MR3022	Overage
	Auto 2:2 duplex	included	\$0.006675
	Photo Mode	included	
	Book Copy	included	
	Job Programs	included	
	2-in-1	included	
	margin shift	included	
	covers	included	
	erase	included	
	interrupt key	included	
	interrupt key	included	
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	
	quantity selector 1-999 (min.)	included	
	finisher 1000/30/1	MJ1101	
	copy control/elec. auditron (10 accounts min.)	included	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	600 X 600dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 25-400% zoom with presets	included	
Memory	16 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Saddle Stitch Finisher	Saddle Stitch Finisher	MJ1024	\$0.00190000
Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch	MJ 6004	\$0.00040000
Work Tray	Provides work surface on Copier	KK4550	\$0.00010000
Print Enabler	Network Printing	GM1010	\$0.00280000
Print /Scan Enabler	Network Printing and Scanning	GM2010	\$0.00480000
Scan Upgrade Enabler	Adds scanning to GM1010	GM3010	\$0.00100000
Wireless LAN Adapter	Wireless Network Print and Scan for GM1010 or GM2010	GN1050	\$0.00090000
Fax Board	Allows walk-up Fax	GD1250	\$0.00080000
2nd Line Fax	2nd Line Fax	GD1260	\$0.00070000
Scrambler Board	Hard Drive Eraser	GP1080	\$0.00110000
Data Overwrite	Data Overwrite	GP1050	\$0.00060000

Black & White Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	40 - 49 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	40,000	AAIS MAT#	10119116
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 455

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan
Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 455	
Features	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications		\$0.00740000
	Three paper sources (3,500 sheets min.)	LCF KD1026	
	plus bypass tray	included	Overage
	RADF	MR3022	\$0.005550
	Auto 2:2 duplex	included	
	photo mode	included	
	book copy	included	
	job programs	included	
	2-in-1	included	
	margin shift	included	
	erase	included	
	interrupt key	included	
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	
	quantity selector 1-999 (min.)	included	
	finisher 1500/50/1	MJ1101	
	copy control/elec. auditor (10 accounts min.)	included	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	600 X 600dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-400% zoom with presets	included	
Memory	32 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Saddle Stitch Finisher	Saddle Stitch Finisher	MJ1024	\$0.00140000
Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch	MJ 6004	\$0.00030000
Work Tray	Provides work surface on Copier	KK4550	\$0.00010000
Print Enabler	Network Printing	GM1010	\$0.00210000
Print /Scan Enabler	Network Printing and Scanning	GM2010	\$0.00380000
Scan Upgrade Enabler	Adds scanning to GM1010	GM3010	\$0.00070000
Wireless LAN Adapter	Wireless Network Print and Scan for GM1010 or GM2010	GN1050	\$0.00070000
Fax Board	Allows walk-up Fax	GD1250	\$0.00060000
2nd Line Fax	2nd Line Fax	GD1260	\$0.00050000
Scrambler Board	Hard Drive Eraser	GP1080	\$0.00080000
Data Overwrite	Data Overwrite	GP1050	\$0.00050000

Black & White Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	50 - 59 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	50,000	AAIS MAT#	10119117
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 555

Counties to be covered at this price:
 Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan
 Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order: 15 Days

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service
Type	Console; digital scanner	e-studio 555	Black & White Cost
Features	Four paper sources (4,000 sht. min.)	LCF MP4004	\$0.00810000
	including bypass (50 sht. min.) tray	included	
	RADF	included	Overage
	Auto 2:2 duplex	included	\$0.006075
	photo mode	included	
	book copy	included	
	job programs	included	
	2-in-1	included	
	booklet mode	included	
	margin shift	included	
	covers	included	
	erase	included	
	interrupt key	included	
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	
	quantity selector 1-999 (min.)	MJ1027	
	finisher 2000/50/3	included	
	copy control/elec. auditron (10 accts min.)	included	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	600 X 600dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 25-400% zoom with presets	included	
Memory	32 MB		

Support Cost

Advanced Installation	Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting	Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
50 sheet saddle stitch finisher	50 sheet saddle stitch finisher	MJ1028	\$0.00220000
100 sheet saddle stitch finisher	100 sheet saddle stitch finisher	MJ1029	\$0.00310000
Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch	MJ6003	\$0.00030000
Post Inserter	Inserts pre-printed covers	MJ7001	\$0.00060000
Scrambler Board	Scrambles Data for Security	GP1080	\$0.00070000
Data Overwrite Enabler	Hard Drive Eraser	GP1070	\$0.00040000
Print Enabler	Network Printing	GM1050	\$0.00170000
Print/Scan Enabler	Network Printing/Scanning	GM2040	\$0.00300000
Scan Upgrade Enabler	Adds Scan to GM1050	GM4010	\$0.00090000
Wireless 80211g	Wireless Network (GM1050 or GM2040 required)	GN1050	\$0.00040000
Bluetooth	Bluetooth	GN2010	\$0.00020000
Fax Board	Walk up Fax	GD1250	\$0.00060000

Black & White Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	60 + Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	75,000	AAIS MAT#	10119118
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 655

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order: 15 **Days**

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service
Type	Console; digital scanner	e-studio 655	Black & White Cost
Features	Five paper sources (5,000 sht. min.)	LCF MP4004	\$0.00770000
	including bypass (50 sht. min.) tray	included	
	RADF	included	Overage
	Auto 2:2 duplex	included	\$0.005775
	photo mode	included	
	book copy	included	
	job programs	included	
	2-in-1	included	
	booklet mode	included	
	margin shift	included	
	covers	included	
	erase	included	
	interrupt key	included	
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	
	QUANTITY SELECTOR 1-999 (min.)	included	
	finisher 2000/50/3	MJ1027	
	copy control/elect. auditron (10 accts min.)	included	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	600 X 600dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 25-400% zoom with presets	included	
Memory	32 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation	Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting	Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
50 sheet saddle stitch finisher	50 sheet saddle stitch finisher	MJ1028	\$0.00150000
100 sheet saddle stitch finisher	100 sheet saddle stitch finisher	MJ1029	\$0.00210000
Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch	MJ6003	\$0.00020000
Post Inserter	Inserts pre-printed covers	MJ7001	\$0.00040000
Scrambler Board	Scrambles Data for Security	GP1080	\$0.00040000
Data Overwrite Enabler	Hard Drive Eraser	GP1060	\$0.00030000
Print Enabler	Network Printing	GM1050	\$0.00110000
Print/Scan Enabler	Network Printing/Scanning	GM2040	\$0.00200000
Scan Upgrade Enabler	Adds Scan to GM1050	GM4010	\$0.00060000
Wireless 80211g	Wireless Network (GM1050 or GM2040 required)	GN1050	\$0.00030000
Bluetooth	Bluetooth	GN2010	\$0.00020000
Fax Board	Walk up Fax	GD1250	\$0.00040000

Black & White Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	80 + Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	100,000	AASIS MAT#	10119119
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 855

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Cost (CPC)
Type	Console; digital scanner	e-studio 855	Maintenance/Service
Features	Five paper sources (5,000 sht. min.)	LCF MP4004	Black & White Cost
	including bypass (50 sht. min.) tray	included	\$0.00790000
	RADF	included	
	Auto 2:2 duplex	included	Overage
	photo mode	included	\$0.005925
	book copy	included	
	job programs	included	
	2-in-1	included	
	booklet mode	included	
	margin shift	included	
	covers	included	
	erase	included	
	interrupt key	included	
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	
	QUANTITY SELECTOR 1-999 (min.)	included	
	finisher 2000/50/3	MJ1027	
	copy control/elect. auditor (10 accts min.)	included	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	600 X 600dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 25-400% zoom with presets	included	
Memory	32 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
50 sheet saddle stitch finisher	50 sheet saddle stitch finisher	MJ1028	\$0.00110000
100 sheet saddle stitch finisher	100 sheet saddle stitch finisher	MJ1029	\$0.00160000
Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch	MJ6003	\$0.00020000
Post Inserter	Inserts pre-printed covers	MJ7001	\$0.00030000
Scrambler Board	Scrambles Data for Security	GP1080	\$0.00030000
Data Overwrite Enabler	Hard Drive Eraser	GP1060	\$0.00020000
Print Enabler	Network Printing	GM1050	\$0.00090000
Print/Scan Enabler	Network Printing/Scanning	GM2040	\$0.00150000
Scan Upgrade Enabler	Adds Scan to GM1050	GM4010	\$0.00040000
Wireless 80211g	Wireless Network (GM1050 or GM2040 required)	GN1050	\$0.00020000
Bluetooth	Bluetooth	GN2010	\$0.00010000
Fax Board	Walk up Fax	GD1260	\$0.00030000

Graphic Color Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	10 - 14 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	400 Color	AAIS MAT#	10119110
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 2330

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order: 15 Days

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Cost (CPC)
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 2330/Stand	
Features	Single paper source (250 sheets minimum)	included	\$0.10000000
	plus a Bypass tray	included	
	Manual Document Feed	KA3511	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost (CPC)
	Photo Mode	included	
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (minimum)	included	
Originals	8 1/2" X 14"	included	\$0.01900000
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 8 1/2" X 14"	included	
Resolution	400 X 400dpi	included	Color Coverage
Reduction & Enlargement	Not Required	included	\$0.075000
Memory	4 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation	Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting	Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
RADF	Reversing Automatic Document Feeder	MR3018	\$0.01120000
Cassette	Cassette	MJ1031	\$0.01430000
Finisher	Finisher	MJ1101	\$0.02250000
Saddle Stitch Finisher	Saddle Stitch Finisher	MJ1030	\$0.02860000
LCF	1500 sheet LCF	MJ6101	\$0.00560000
Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch	KD1023	\$0.00760000
ADU	Automatic Duplex Unit	MY1032	\$0.00440000
S300 External Controler	S300 External Controler	KD1024	\$0.00970000
X3ePlus Embedded Controler	X3ePlus Embedded Controler	GP1080	\$0.01630000

Graphic Color Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	15 - 19 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	800 Color	AAIS MAT#	10119111
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 2330

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order: 15 **Days**

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 2330/stand	Color Cost (CPC)
Features	Single paper source (250 sheets minimum)	included	\$0.05400000
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	ADF	MR3018	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost (CPC)
	Photo Mode	included	
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (minimum)	included	
Originals	To 8 1/2" X 14"	included	\$0.10000000
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 8 1/2" X 14"	included	
Resolution	400 X 400dpi	included	Color Overage
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-200% zoom w/presets	included	\$0.040500
Memory	6 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Hanging Finisher	Hanging Finisher	MJ1031	\$0.00720000
Multi Position Finisher	Multi Position Finisher	MJ1101	\$0.01130000
Saddle Stich Finisher	Saddle Stich Finisher	MJ1030	\$0.01430000
2/3 Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch Unit	MJ6101	\$0.00280000
Paper Feeder Pedestal	Paper Feeder Pedestal	KD1023	\$0.00380000
Cassett for PFP	Cassett for PFP	MY1032	\$0.00220000
2500 Sheet LCF	2500 Sheet LCF	KD1024	\$0.00490000
Scrambler Board	Scrambler Board	GP1080	\$0.00820000
Wireless Print/Scan	Wireless Print/Scan	GN1050	\$0.00650000
Walk up Fax Option	Walk up Fax Option	GD1250	\$0.00620000
2nd Fax Line	2nd Fax Line	GD1260	\$0.00500000

Graphic Color Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	20 - 24 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	1,500 Color	AAIS MAT#	10119112
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 2330

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Color Cost (CPC)
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 2330/stand	
	Two paper sources (500 sheets minimum)	included	\$0.03300000
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	ADF	MR3018	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost (CPC)
	Auto 2:2 duplex	included	
	Photo Mode	included	
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (Minimum)	included	\$0.10000000
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	Color Overage
	Book Copy	included	\$0.024750
	2-in-1	included	
	Job Programs	included	
	10BS or Electronic sorting	included	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	400 X 400dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-200% Zoom w/presets	included	
Memory	8 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Hanging Finisher	Hanging Finisher	MJ1031	\$0.00720000
Multi Position Finisher	Multi Position Finisher	MJ1101	\$0.01130000
Saddle Stich Finisher	Saddle Stich Finisher	MJ1030	\$0.01430000
2/3 Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch Unit	MJ6101	\$0.00280000
Paper Feeder Pedestal	Paper Feeder Pedestal	KD1023	\$0.00380000
Cassett for PFP	Cassett for PFP	MY1032	\$0.00220000
2500 Sheet LCF	2500 Sheet LCF	KD1024	\$0.00490000
Scrambler Board	Scrambler Board	GP1080	\$0.00820000
Wireless Print/Scan	Wireless Print/Scan	GN1050	\$0.00650000
Walk up Fax Option	Walk up Fax Option	GD1250	\$0.00620000
2nd Fax Line	2nd Fax Line	GD1260	\$0.00500000

Graphic Color Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	25 - 29 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	2,000 Color	AAIS MAT#	10119113
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 2330

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Color Cost (CPC)
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 2330	
Features	Two paper sources (1,500 sheets minimum)	KD1011	\$0.02990000
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	ADF	MR3006A	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost (CPC)
	Auto 2:2 duplex,	MD5007	
	Photo Mode	included	
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (Minimum)	included	\$0.10000000
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	Color Coverage
	book copy	included	\$0.022425
	2-in-1	included	
	job programs	included	
	finisher 1000/20/1	MJ1023	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	400 X 400dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-200% Zoom w/presets	included	
Memory	12 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Saddle Stich Finisher	Saddle Stich Finisher	MJ1030	\$0.01430000
2/3 Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch Unit	MJ6101	\$0.00280000
Paper Feeder Pedestal	Paper Feeder Pedestal	KD1023	\$0.00380000
Cassett for PFP	Cassett for PFP	MY1032	\$0.00220000
2500 Sheet LCF	2500 Sheet LCF	KD1024	\$0.00490000
Scrambler Board	Scrambler Board	GP1080	\$0.00820000
Wireless Print/Scan	Wireless Print/Scan	GN1050	\$0.00650000
Walk up Fax Option	Walk up Fax Option	GD1250	\$0.00620000
2nd Fax Line	2nd Fax Line	GD1260	\$0.00500000

Graphic Color Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	30 - 34 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	4,000 Color	AAIS MAT#	10119114
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 2830

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 2803	Color Cost (CPC)
Features	Three paper sources (3,000 sheets min.)	KD1012	\$0.01990000
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	RADF	MR3018	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost (CPC)
	Auto 2:2 Duplex	MD5007	
	Photo Mode	included	
	Book Copy	included	
	Job Programs	included	
	2-in-1	included	
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (min.)	included	
	Finisher 1000/30/1	MJ1101	
	Copy Control/Elec. Auditron (10 accounts min.)	included	\$0.10000000
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	Color Coverage
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	\$0.014925
Resolution	600 X 600dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-200% zoom w/presets	included	
Memory	16 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Saddle Stich Finisher	Saddle Stich Finisher	MJ1030	\$0.00290000
2/3 Hole Punch Unit	2/3 Hole Punch Unit	MJ6101	\$0.00060000
Scrambler Board	Scrambler Board	GP1080	\$0.00820000
Wireless Print/Scan	Wireless Print/Scan	GN1050	\$0.00650000
Walk up Fax Option	Walk up Fax Option	GD1250	\$0.00620000
2nd Fax Line	2nd Fax Line	GD1260	\$0.00500000

Graphic Color Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	35 - 39 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	6,000 Color	AASIS MAT#	10119115
Manufacturer Brand:		Model #	

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan
 Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell **Days**

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Cost (CPC)
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner		
Features	Three paper sources (3,000 sheets min.) plus Bypass tray RADF Auto 2:2 duplex Photo Mode Book Copy Job Programs 2-in-1 managers base interrupt key interrupt key APS ATS quantity selector 1-999 (min.) finisher 100/30/1 copy control/elec. auditor (10 accounts min.)		\$0.000000 Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost (CPC) \$0.010000 Color coverage \$0.000000
Origins	11" X 17"		
Products Copied	8 1/2" to 11" X 17"		
Resolution	600 X 600dpi		
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 25-400% zoom with presets		
Memory	16 MB		

Support Cost

Advanced Installation	Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting	Per Hour	\$0.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)

NO BID

Graphic Color Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	40 - 49 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	8,000 Color	AAIS MAT#	10119116
Manufacturer Brand:		Model #	

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan
 Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Days

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner		Color (CPC)
Features	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications		\$0.000000
	Three paper sources (3,500 sheet plus bypass tray)		Maintenance/Service
	RADF		Black & White Cost
	Auto 2:2 duplex		(PC)
	Book copy		\$0.00000000
	Job program		Color Overage
	2-in-1		\$0.000000
	margin sheet		
	erase		
	interrupt key		
	APS		
	ATS		
	quantity selector 1-999 (min.)		
	1500/50/1		
	copy control/elec. auditor (10 accounts min.)		
Originals	To 11" X 17"		
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"		
Resolution	600 X 600dpi		
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-400% zoom with presets		
Memory	32 MB		

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$0.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)

NO BID

Graphic Color Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	50 - 59 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	10,000 Color	AAIS MAT#	10119117
Manufacturer Brand:		Model #	

Counties to be covered at this price:
 Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Days

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Color Cost (CPC)
Type	Console; digital scanner		
Features	Four paper sources (4,000 sht. min.) including bypass (50 sht. min.) tray		\$0.00000000
	RADF		
	Auto 2:2 duplex		
	photo mode		
	book copy		\$0.00000000
	job programs		
	2-in-1		
	booklet mode		Color Overlay \$0.00000000
	margin shift		
	covers		
	eraser		
	interrupt key		
	S		
	S		
	quantity selected 1-999 (min.)		
	finisher 2000 /3		
	copy control c. auditoron (10 acct)		
Original	up to 11" X 17"		
Produce	1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"		
Resolution	300 X 600		
Reduction & Enlargement	image approx. 25-400% zoom with presets		
Memory	32		

NO BID

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$0.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)

Graphic Color Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	60 + Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	15,000 Color	AAIS MAT#	10119118
Manufacturer Brand:		Model #	

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service or Cost (CPC)
Type	Console; digital scanner		
Features	Five paper sources (5,000 sht. min.) including bypass (50 sht. min.) tray RADF Auto 2:2 photo mode book copy job programs 2 b/w let mode margin shift colors e interrupt key A AT		0.000000 Maintenance/Service Part & Waste Cost (CPC) 0.000000
	QUANTITY SELECTOR 1-999 (min.) finisher 2000/50/3 copy control/elect. auditor (10 accts min.)		Color Coverage \$0.000000
Originals	To 11" X 17"		
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"		
Resolution	600 X 600dpi		
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 25-400% zoom with presets		
Memory	32 MB		

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$0.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)

NO BID

Business Color Hybrid Machines

Hybrid Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	10 - 14 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	2,000	AAIS MAT#	10119110
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 3511

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 3511/stand	Black & White Cost (CPC)
Features	Single paper source (250 sheets minimum)	included	\$0.08970000
	plus a Bypass tray	included	
	Manual Document Feed	KA3511	Maintenance/Service
	Photo Mode	included	Color Cost (CPC)
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (minimum)	included	\$0.08000000
Originals	8 1/2" X 14"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 8 1/2" X 14"	included	BW Overage Cost
Resolution	400 X 400dpi	included	\$0.06727500
Reduction & Enlargement	Not Required	included	
Memory	4 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$250.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Print/Scan	Print/Scan	e-3511	\$0.00000000
RADF	Reversing Automatic Document Feeder	MR3015	\$0.01120000
Hanging Finisher	Hanging Finisher	MJ1022	\$0.01430000
Muti Position Finisher	Muti Position Finisher	MJ1023	\$0.02250000
Saddle Stitch Finisher	Saddle Stitch Finisher	MJ1024	\$0.02860000
Hole Punch	2/3 Hole Punch Unit	MJ6004	\$0.00560000
Paper Feed Pedestal	Paper Feed Pedestal	KD1011	\$0.00760000
Cassette for PFP	Requies KD1011	MY1021	\$0.00440000
Large Capacity Feeder	2500 Sheet LCF	KD1012	\$0.00970000
Scrambler Board	Scrambler Board	GP1030	\$0.01630000
Wireless LAN Adapter	Wireless Print/Scan	GN1010	\$0.01300000
Fax Board	Walk Up Fax Option	GD1150	\$0.01240000

Hybrid Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	15 - 19 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	4,000	AAIS MAT#	10119111
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 3511

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 3511/stand	Black & White Cost (CPC)
Features	Single paper source (250 sheets minimum)	included	\$0.04890000
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	ADF	MR3015	Maintenance/Service Color Cost (CPC)
	Photo Mode	included	
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (minimum)	included	\$0.08000000
Originals	To 8 1/2" X 14"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 8 1/2" X 14"	included	BW Overage Cost
Resolution	400 X 400dpi	included	\$0.03667500
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-200% zoom w/presets	included	
Memory	6 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$250.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Print/Scan	Print/Scan	e-3511	\$0.00
Hanging Finisher	Hanging Finisher	MJ1031	\$0.01
Muti Position Finisher	Muti Position Finisher	MJ1101	\$0.01
Saddle Stitch Finisher	Saddle Stitch Finisher	MJ1030	\$0.01
Hole Punch	2/3 Hole Punch Unit	MJ6101	\$0.00
Paper Feed Pedestal	Paper Feed Pedestal	KD1023	\$0.00
Cassette for PFP	Requires KD1011	MY1032	\$0.00
Large Capacity Feeder	2500 Sheet LCF	KD1024	\$0.00
Scrambler Board	Scrambler Board	GP1080	\$0.01
Wireless LAN Adapter	Wireless Print/Scan	GN1050	\$0.01
Fax Board	Walk Up Fax Option	GD1250	\$0.01
2nd Fax Line	2nd Fax Line	GD1260	\$0.01

Hybrid Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	20 - 24 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	7,500	AAIS MAT#	10119112
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 3511

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan
Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost (CPC)
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 3511/stand	
Features	Two paper sources (500 sheets minimum)	included	\$0.02900000
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	ADF	MR3015	Maintenance/Service Color Cost (CPC)
	Auto 2:2 duplex	included	
	Photo Mode	included	\$0.08000000
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (Minimum)	included	
	APS	included	BW Overage Cost
	ATS	included	\$0.02175000
	Book Copy	included	
	2-in-1	included	
	Job Programs	included	
	10BS or Electronic sorting	included	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	400 X 400dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-200% Zoom w/presets	included	
Memory	8 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$250.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Component Identification	Cost (CPC)
Print/Scan	Print/Scan	e-3511	\$0.00000000
Hanging Finisher	Hanging Finisher	MJ1022	\$0.00380000
Muti Position Finisher	Muti Position Finisher	MJ1023	\$0.00600000
Saddle Stitch Finisher	Saddle Stitch Finisher	MJ1024	\$0.00760000
Hole Punch	2/3 Hole Punch Unit	MJ6004	\$0.00150000
Paper Feed Pedestal	Paper Feed Pedestal	KD1011	\$0.00200000
Cassette for PFP	Requies KD1011	MY1021	\$0.00120000
Large Capacity Feeder	2500 Sheet LCF	KD1012	\$0.00260000
Scrambler Board	Scrambler Board	GP1030	\$0.00440000
Wireless LAN Adapter	Wireless Print/Scan	GN1010	\$0.00350000
Fax Board	Walk Up Fax Option	GD1150	\$0.00330000
2nd Fax Line	2nd Fax Line	GD1160	\$0.00270000

Hybrid Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	25 - 29 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	10,000	AAIS MAT#	10119113
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 3511

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand, digital scanner	e-studio 3511	Black & White Cost (CPC)
Features	Two paper sources (1,500 sheets minimum)	KD1011	\$0.02640000
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	ADF	MR3015	Maintenance/Service
	Auto 2:2 duplex,	included	Color Cost (CPC)
	Photo Mode	included	\$0.08000000
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (Minimum)	included	
	APS	included	BW Overage Cost
	ATS	included	\$0.01980000
	book copy	included	
	2-in-1	included	
	job programs	included	
	finisher 1000/20/1	MJ1023	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	400 X 400dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-200% Zoom w/presets	included	
Memory	12 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$250.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Print/Scan	Print/Scan	e-3511	\$0.00000000
Saddle Stitch Finisher	Saddle Stitch Finisher	MJ1024	\$0.00570000
Hole Punch	2/3 Hole Punch Unit	MJ6004	\$0.00110000
Cassette for PFP	Requires KD1011	MY1021	\$0.00090000
Large Capacity Feeder	2500 Sheet LCF	KD1012	\$0.00190000
Scrambler Board	Scrambler Board	GP1030	\$0.00330000
Wireless LAN Adapter	Wireless Print/Scan	GN1010	\$0.00260000
Fax Board	Walk Up Fax Option	GD1150	\$0.00250000
2nd Fax Line	2nd Fax Line	GD1160	\$0.00200000
128 MB Memory	128 MB Memory	GC1180	\$0.00030000

Hybrid Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	30 - 34 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	20,000	AAIS MAT#	10119114
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 3511

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order: 15 Days

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Black & White Cost (CPC)
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 3511	
Features	Three paper sources (3,000 sheets min.)	KD1012	\$0.01490000
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	RADF	MR3015	Maintenance/Service Color Cost (CPC)
	Auto 2:2 Duplex	included	\$0.08000000
	Photo Mode	included	
	Book Copy	included	
	Job Programs	included	BW Overage Cost
	2-in-1	included	\$0.01117500
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	
	Quantity Selector 1-99 (min.)	included	
	Finisher 1000/30/1	MJ1023	
	Copy Control/Elec. Auditron (10 accounts min.)	included	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	600 X 600dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-200% zoom w/presets	included	
Memory	16 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation	Flat Fee	\$250.00
Networking & Troubleshooting	Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Print/Scan	Print/Scan	e-3511	\$0.00000000
Saddle Stitch Finisher	Saddle Stitch Finisher	MJ1024	\$0.00290000
Hole Punch	2/3 Hole Punch Unit	MJ6004	\$0.00060000
Scrambler Board	Scrambler Board	GP1030	\$0.00160000
Wireless LAN Adapter	Wireless Print/Scan	GN1010	\$0.00130000
Fax Board	Walk Up Fax Option	GD1150	\$0.00130000
2nd Fax Line	2nd Fax Line	GD1160	\$0.00100000
128 MB Memory	128 MB Memory	GC1180	\$0.00010000

Hybrid Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	35 - 39 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	30,000	AAIS MAT#	10119115
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 3511

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 3511	Black & White Cost (CPC)
Features	Three paper sources (3,000 sheets min.)	KD1012	\$0.01170000
	plus Bypass tray	included	
	RADF	MR3015	Maintenance/Service
	Auto 2:2 duplex	included	Color Cost (CPC)
	Photo Mode	included	\$0.08000000
	Bood Copy	included	
	Job Programs	included	BW Overage Cost
	2-in-1	included	\$0.00877500
	margin shift	included	
	covers	included	
	erase	included	
	interrupt key	included	
	interrupt key	included	
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	
	quantity selector 1-999 (min.)	included	
	finisher 1000/30/1	MJ1023	
	copy control/elec. auditron (10 accounts min.)	included	
Originals	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	600 X 600dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 25-400% zoom with presets	included	
Memory	16 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$250.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Print/Scan	Print/Scan	e-3511	\$0.00000000
Saddle Stitch Finisher	Saddle Stitch Finisher	MJ1024	\$0.00190000
Hole Punch	2/3 Hole Punch Unit	MJ6004	\$0.00040000
Scrambler Board	Scrambler Board	GP1030	\$0.00110000
Wireless LAN Adapter	Wireless Print/Scan	GN1010	\$0.00090000
Fax Board	Walk Up Fax Option	GD1150	\$0.00080000
2nd Fax Line	2nd Fax Line	GD1160	\$0.00070000
128 MB Memory	128 MB Memory	GC1180	\$0.00010000

Hybrid Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	40 - 49 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	40,000	AAIS MAT#	10119116
Manufacturer Brand:	Toshiba	Model #	e-Studio 4511

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan
Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Estimated Delivery timeline after receipt of order:	15	Days
--	----	-------------

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service
Type	Desktop with Enclosed Base/Stand; digital scanner	e-studio 4511	Black & White Cost (CPC)
Features	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	included	\$0.01090000
	Three paper sources (3,500 sheets min.)	KD1012	
	plus bypass tray	included	Maintenance/Service
	RADF	MR3015	Color Cost (CPC)
	Auto 2:2 duplex	included	\$0.08000000
	photo mode	included	
	book copy	included	BW Overage Cost
	job programs	included	\$0.00817500
	2-in-1	included	
	margin shift	included	
	erase	included	
	interrupt key	included	
	APS	included	
	ATS	included	
	quantity selector 1-999 (min.)	included	
	finisher 1500/50/1	MJ1023	
	copy control/elec. auditor (10 accounts min.)	included	
	To 11" X 17"	included	
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"	included	
Resolution	600 X 600dpi	included	
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 50-400% zoom with presets	included	
Memory	32 MB	included	

Support Cost

Advanced Installation	Flat Fee	\$250.00
Networking & Troubleshooting	Per Hour	\$75.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)
Print/Scan	Print/Scan	e-4511	\$0.00000000
Saddle Stitch Finisher	Saddle Stitch Finisher	MJ1024	\$0.00140000
Hole Punch	2/3 Hole Punch Unit	MJ6004	\$0.00030000
Scrambler Board	Scrambler Board	GP1030	\$0.00080000
Wireless LAN Adapter	Wireless Print/Scan	GN1010	\$0.00070000
Fax Board	Walk Up Fax Option	GD1150	\$0.00060000
2nd Fax Line	2nd Fax Line	GD1160	\$0.00050000
128 MB Memory	128 MB Memory	GC1180	\$0.00010000

Hybrid Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	50 - 59 Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	50,000	AAIS MAT#	10119117
Manufacturer Brand:		Model #	

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Cost
Type	Console; digital scanner		Black & White Cost
Features	Four paper sources (4,000 sht. min.) including bypass (50 sht. min.) tray		\$0.000000
	RADF		Maintenance/Service for Color (CPC)
	Auto 2		\$0.000000
	photo mode		
	book copy		
	job programs		
	2		
	let mode		
	margin shift		
	covers		
	enter		
	interrupt key		
	AP		
	ATS		
	quantity selector 1-999 (min.)		
	finisher 2000/50/3		
	copy control/elec. auditron (10 accts min.)		
Originals	To 11" X 17"		
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"		
Resolution	600 X 600dpi		
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 25-400% zoom with presets		
Memory	32 MB		

Support Cost

Advanced Installation	Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting	Per Hour	\$0.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)

NO BID

Graphic Color Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	60 + Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	75,000	AASIS MAT#	10119118
Manufacturer Brand:		Model #	

Counties to be covered at this price:
 Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan
 Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell | **Days**

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Cost (CPC)
Type	Console; digital scanner		
Features	Five paper sources (5,000 sht. min.) including bypass (50 sht. min.) tray		\$0.000000
	RADF		
	Auto 2:2 duplex		
	photo mode		
	book copy		
	job programs		
	2-in		
	booklet mode		
	main shift		
	covers		
	erase		
	interrupt key		
	A		
	A		
	QUANTITY SELECTOR 1-999 (min.)		
	finish 0/50/3		
	copy control/elect. auditor (10 accts min.)		
Originals	To 11" X 17"		
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"		
Resolution	600 X 600dpi		
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 25-400% zoom with presets		
Memory	32 MB		

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$0.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)

NO BID

Graphic Color Machines

Vendor Name:	Standard Business Systems		
Speed:	80 + Pages per Minute	AASIS VEN#	100001815
Monthly Maximum Volume:	100,000	AASIS MAT#	10119119
Manufacturer Brand:		Model #	

Counties to be covered at this price:

Arkansas, Clark, Cleburne, Conway, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot Springs, Jackson, Jefferson, Johnson, Lincoln, Logan, Lonoke, Monroe, Perry, Pope, Prairie, Pulaski, Saline, Van Buren, White, Woodruff, Yell

Days

Hardware Requirements & Maintenance/Service Cost

Unit Requirements	Required Capabilities- Minimum Specifications	Part #	Maintenance/Service Cost (CPC)
Type	Console; digital scanner		Black & White Cost
Features	Five paper sources (5,000 sht. min.) including bypass (50 sht. min.) tray		(CPC) \$0.000000
	RADF		
	Auto 2:2		
	photo mode		Maintenance/Service for Color (CPC) \$0.000000
	book copy		
	job programs		
	27		
	bullet mode		BW Overage \$0.000000
	margin shift		
	overs		
	erase		
	interrupt key		
	ATC		
	QUANTITY SELECTOR 1-999 (min.)		
	finisher 2000/50/3		
	copy control/elect. auditor (10 accts min.)		
Originals	To 11" X 17"		
Produces Copies	5 1/2" X 8 1/2" to 11" X 17"		
Resolution	600 X 600dpi		
Reduction & Enlargement	Range approx. 25-400% zoom with presets		
Memory	32 MB		

Support Cost

Advanced Installation		Flat Fee	\$0.00
Networking & Troubleshooting		Per Hour	\$0.00

Accessories & Additional Features Cost

Component Description	Component Capabilities	Part #	Cost (CPC)

NO BID