SP-15-0032 Ammunition

Remington

Speer

Federal

Winchester

AASIS Material [Description Cruse Uniforms & Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors Precision Delta Corp.
# Effective: January 23, 2016 Equipment Inc.

Steve@cruseuniforms.com Tommy@gqulfstatesdist.com Tommy@gqulfstatesdist.com Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 1 |Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

3 1

Mfg# Price/M Mfg# Price/M Mfg# Price/M Mfg# Price/M
10100060 357 Magnum, 125gr, Jacketed Hollow Point 29400 $326.00 53920 $ 357.00 |No Bid No Bid X3576P $397.00
10100062 357 SIG, 125gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo 23734 $277.50 53919 $ 247.75 [No Bid No Bid Q4309 $ 366.00
10100061 357 SIG, 125gr, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded 29408 $360.50 53918 $ 372.75 |No Bid No Bid RA357SB $ 464.00
10100063 38 Special, 130gr, Full Metal Jacket 23730 $255.00 No Bid No Bid AE38K $ 293.16 Q4171 $277.00
10100064 38 Special, 125gr, +P, Jacketed Hollow Point 29432 $299.50 53722 $ 358.50 |No Bid No Bid X38S7PH $291.00
10100065 38 Special, Blank No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 38SBLP $476.00
10100066 9mm Luger, 115gr, Full Metal Jacket 23728 $200.00 53650 $ 187.25 |No Bid No Bid Q4172 $ 180.50
10124520 9mm Luger, 124gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo 23718 $244.00 53651 $ 187.25 [No Bid No Bid USA9MM $ 189.00
10100067 9mm Luger, 124gr, Jacketed Hollow Point 29420 $327.00 No Bid No Bid POHST1 $ 251.45 |[No Bid No Bid
10100068 9mm Luger, 124gr, +P, Jacketed Hollow Point 29424 $334.00 No Bid No Bid POHST3 $ 251.45 |RA9124TP $281.00
10100069 9mm Luger, 124gr, +P, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded 29351 $360.00 53617 $ 315.00 |No Bid No Bid RA9BA $362.00
10126760 9mm Luger, 147gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo 23732 $ 255.00 53620 $ 187.25 [No Bid No Bid USA9MM1 $222.00
10100070 9mm Luger, 147gr, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded 29352 $366.00 53619 $ 309.75 |No Bid No Bid RA9B $ 362.00
10100071 10mm Semi-auto, 180gr, Full Metal Jacket 23706 $290.00 No Bid No Bid AE10A $ 436.00 |[No Bid No Bid
10100073 40 S&W, 165gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo 23746 $ 258.00 53955 $ 224.70 |No Bid No Bid USA40SW $214.00
10100074 40 S&W, 165gr, Jacketed Hollow Point 29440 $306.00 No Bid No Bid P40HST3 $ 304.00 |RA40TA $ 316.00
10124521 40 S&W, 165gr, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded 29366 $383.00 53970 $ 336.00 |No Bid No Bid RA40BA $ 381.00
10126761 40 S&W, 180gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo 23742 $260.00 53652 $ 224.70 [No Bid No Bid Q4238 $227.00
10126762 40 S&W, 180gr, Jacketed Hollow Point 29442 $314.00 No Bid No Bid P40HST1 $ 304.00 |RA40T $ 316.50
10100075 40 S&W, 180gr, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded 29436 $370.00 53962 $ 336.00 [No Bid No Bid RA40B $ 381.50
10124522 45 Auto, 185gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo 23818 $299.00 53654 $ 262.15 |No Bid No Bid USA45A $ 286.00
10100078 45 Auto, 185gr, +P, Jacketed Hollow Point 29450 $383.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10126764 45 Auto, 185gr, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded 29414 $489.00 53964 $ 388.50 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10100076 45 Auto, 230gr, Full Metal Jacket, Training Ammo 23726 $ 283.00 No Bid No Bid AE45A $ 304.95 Q4170 $ 258.40
10100077 45 Auto, 230gr, Jacketed Hollow Point 29448 $372.00 No Bid No Bid PA5HST2 $ 342.40 |RA45T $421.00
10100079 45 Auto, 230gr, Jacketed Hollow Point, Bonded 29416 $438.00 53966 $ 395.00 [No Bid No Bid RA45B $ 484.00
10100080 223/5.56, 55gr, Full Metal Jacket 23711 $366.00 No Bid No Bid XM193 $ 308.00 |Q3131 $ 324.00
10124523 223/5.56, 55gr, Balistic Tip 29192 $555.00 No Bid No Bid T223F $ 513.60 |RA223BSTA $ 732.00
10124524 223/5.56, 55¢r, Soft Point 28399 $390.00 No Bid No Bid T223A $ 363.00 |RA223R $ 504.00
10126766 223/5.56, 62gr, Full Metal Jacket 23815 $318.00 No Bid No Bid AE223N $ 319.00 |USA223R3 $421.00
10100081 223/5.56, 62gr, Hollow Point, Match Grade 22106 $432.00 No Bid No Bid GM223M $ 715.00 |No Bid No Bid
10126767 223/5.56, 62gr, Soft Point, Match Grade, Bonded 28918 $721.00 No Bid No Bid LE223T3 $ 907.50 |RA556B $ 740.40
10100083 308, 150gr, Soft Point 27842 $659.00 No Bid No Bid LE308T1 $1,017.50 |X3085 $ 728.00

Remington Speer Federal Winchester
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Cruse Uniforms & Gulf States Distributors Gulf States Distributors Precision Delta Corp.
Equipment Inc.

AASIS Material
#

Steve@cruseuniforms.com Tommy@qulfstatesdist.com Tomm ulfstatesdist.com Precdelta@tecinfo.com

Description

Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 1 |Vendor's Minimum Case Quantity: 3

3 1

Mfg# Price/M Mfg# Price/M Mfg# Price/M Mfg# Price/M
10100084 308, 168gr, Hollow Point, Match Grade, Boat-tail 21485 $694.00 No Bid No Bid GM308M-500 $ 702,50 |S308M $837.00
10100085 12ga, Skeet #9, Heavy Load, 2-3/4 plastic hull 20116 $ 377.00 No Bid No Bid TGL12#9 $ 230.00 |AAM129 $ 293.00
10100088 12ga, 00 Buckshot, 9 pellet, 2-3/4 plastic hull 20812 $529.00 No Bid No Bid LE127-00 $ 458.00 |XB1200 $467.40
10124525 12ga. 00 Buckshot, 8 pellet, 2-3/4 plastic hull 20662 $688.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10100089 12aa. 00 Buckshot, 9 pellet, 2-3/4 plastic hull. Reduced Recoil 20643 $533.00 No Bid No Bid LE132-00 $ 458.00 |RA1200 $423.00
10100090 12ga. 00 Buckshot, 8 pellet, 2-3/4 plastic hull. Reduced Recaoil 20645 $515.00 No Bid No Bid LE133-00 $ 458.00 [RA12008 $414.40
10100091 12ga, Rifled Slug. 1 oz, Hollow Point. 2-3/4 plastic hull 20279 $506.00 No Bid No Bid F127-RS $ 458.00 |X12RS15 $ 469.40
10100092 120a.Rifled Slua.loz.Foster slua.2-3/4 plastic hull. Reduced Recoil 20285 $471.00 No Bid No Bid LE127-RS $ 47500 IRAI2RS15 $472.00

Contract Contact Information

Vendors:

Cruse Uniforms & Equipment Steve Cruse Brand: Remington

1201 Barrow Road Steve@cruseuniforms.com Contract No: 4600033832

Little Rock, AR 72205 Phone: 501-223-2778 Vendor No: 100168714
Fax: 501-223-2424

Gulf States Distributors, Inc. Tommmy Trammell Brand: Federal and Speer

6000 E. Shirley Lane Tommy@aulfstatesdist.co Contract No: 4600033839

Montgomery, Al 36117 Phone No: 800-223-7869 Contract No: 4600033834

Fax No: 334-279-9267 Vendor No: 100145319

Precision Delta Corp Patricia Lott Brand: Winchester

P.O. Box 128 Precdelta@tecinfo.com Contract No: 4600033830

Ruleville, Ms 38771 Phone: 662-756-2810 Vendor No: 100149868
Fax: 662-753-2590

OSP:

Tim O'Brien

Statewide Procurement Specialist
Office of State Procurement
Phone: (501) 324-9320

Fax: (501) 324-9311

Email: Timothy.O'Brien@dfa.arkansas.gov
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Office of State Procurement Contact:

Tim O'Brien

Telephone No: 501-324-9320

This Contract is for those State Agencies, Institutions of Higher Education and Political

Subdivisions of the State of Arkansas to obtain ammunition in order to carry out those inherent duties related to their jobs.
PRICES: The price per thousand rounds quoted will be the “Normal Inside Delivery” prices.

Prices quoted do not include any federal excise taxes.

MINIMUM ORDER QUANTITY: Order quantities will be “Full” cases and unless otherwise

noted the minimum order quantity will be as follows:

Cruse Uniforms & Equipment, Inc. (REMINGTON - 4600033832) — Three (3) Cases

Gulf State Dist. (FEDERAL - 4600033839 & SPEER - 4600033834) — One (1) Case

Precision Delta Corporation (WINCHESTER - 4600033834) — Three (3) Cases

**|tems may be combined to satisfy the minimum order quantity**

DELIVERY: Items are to be delivered (FOB Destination —Normal Inside Delivery) to the

location specified.

“Normal Inside Delivery” is defined in this contact as: “The inside delivery to a building with an

accessible loading dock to a specific room or area.

Entities are encouraged to check with the vendor prior to ordering to ascertain any

possible additional delivery charge amount that does not fall into the “Normal Inside Delivery” quote.
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