
 

 
 
 

STATE OF ARKANSAS  OFFICE OF STATE PROCUREMENT
 Marketing and Redistribution 
Department of Finance 6620 Young Road 
 Little Rock, Arkansas 72209 and Administration Phone:  (501) 565-8645   
 Fax: (501) 565-5059  
 http://www.state.ar.us/dfa

 
INVITATION TO BID 

 
BID NUMBER:    MR-15-03 
 
COMMODITY:   Kitchen/Restaurant Equipment   
  
LOCATION:   DFA – MARKETING & REDISTRIBUTION 
     6620 YOUNG ROAD 
     LITTLE ROCK, AR  72209 
 
INSPECTION DATES:  August 19, 20, 21, 22, 25, 26, 27, 2014 
                                           
      
INSPECTION HOURS:  8:00 AM – 3:00 PM 
 
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: August 28, 2014 @ 8:00 AM 

 
ITEMS LISTED ON THE ATTACHED SHEET (S) WILL BE SOLD TO THE HIGHEST BIDDER (S) SUBJECT TO 
ALL “GENERAL” AND IF APPLICABLE, “SPECIAL” TERMS AND CONDITIONS. 
 
BID FORMS MUST BE COMPLETED AND SIGNED TO BE CONSIDERED.  UNSIGNED BIDS OR LATE BIDS 

WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED. 
 
RESPONSE TO INVITATIONS TO BID MUST BE MAILED TO MARKETING & REDISTRIBUTION IN A 
SEALED ENVELOPE INDICATING THE BID NUMBER AND DATE OF THE BID OPENING ON THE OUTSIDE 
OF THE ENVELOPE OR MAY BE HAND CARRIED TO THE MARKETING & REDISTRIBUTION OFFICE. 
RESPONSES MUST BE RECEIVED PRIOR TO THE TIME AND DATE INDICATED ON THE DOCUMENT FOR 
THE BID OPENING IN ORDER TO BE CONSIDERED. 
 
AT THE TIME INDICATED FOR THE BID OPENING ALL BIDS WILL BE PUBLICLY READ AND TABULATED.  
BIDDERS MUST CONTACT MARKETING & REDISTRIBUTION WITHIN 48 HOURS OF THE CLOSING DATE 
AND TIME TO VERIFY BID RESULTS AND PAY FOR PROPERTY.   SUCCESSFUL BIDDERS MUST REMOVE 
AWARDED ITEMS WITHIN FIVE (5) BUSINESS DAYS FROM DATE OF PAYMENT. 
          _____________________  

Please Legibly PRINT all required information (For office use only)

 
YOUR SIGNATURE INDICATES THAT YOU AGREE TO ALL TERMS & CONDITIONS OF THIS SALE 

 
SIGNATURE:             
 
PRINTED NAME:             
 
COMPANY NAME:             
 
ADDRESS:              
        CITY  STATE  ZIP 
BUSINESS PHONE:       HOME PHONE:       
 
CELLULAR PHONE:      FAX NUMBER:       
 

EMAIL ADDRESS:             
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GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
========================================================================= 
1. Bidder is invited, urged & cautioned to inspect property to be sold prior to submitting a bid.  Property will be available for inspection 
at the place and times specified in the invitation.  All property is offered for sale “as is, where is”.  The State makes no warranty, 
expressed or implied as to quality, kind, character, quantity, weight, size or description of any of the property or its fitness for any use or 
purpose.  Any oral statement or representation by any representative of the State is unauthorized and shall confer no right upon the Bidder 
or Purchaser. 
 
2. The purchaser agrees to pay for item(s) awarded to him in accordance with the prices offered in his bid.  All forms of payment must be 
in US currency.  Payment is to be made in the form of cash, check, and postal money order, Visa, Discover or Master Card  Checks must 
be made payable to Marketing & Redistribution.  If payment is made in the form of a check and the financial institution does not honor it a 
$25.00 service fee will be charged and a personal check will not be accepted for up to a one-year period.  
 
3. Unless otherwise specified in the invitation, the purchaser shall be entitled to obtain the property upon vesting of title or the receipt of 
payment for the property.  The purchaser shall be responsible for the loading and removal of property, at his expense.  Marketing & 
Redistribution employees will assist with loading heavy or large items at Marketing & Redistribution as time permits.  In no way will the 
State suffer any expense, penalty, personal or property liability in the removal of said equipment.  Marketing & Redistribution reserves the 
right to cancel a bid and re-bid the property when procedures are not complied with.  
 
4. When bids are signed or when bids are made available via the web site and are submitted via the web, this constitutes a contract with 
the State of Arkansas to pay the amount(s) indicated for the equipment offered for sale.  Failure to comply could result in action being 
taken by the Attorney General’s office and/or be cause for rejection of future bids.  Unsigned bids will not be read or considered.  By 
signing the Invitation for Bid document or by submitting a bid via the web the Bidder warrants that they are not less than eighteen years of 
age.  As mandated in ACA § 19-11-242, Employees of the State of Arkansas Department of Finance and Administration or members of 
their immediate family may not bid.  When an “On Location” sale takes place employees and family members of the agency selling the 
goods may not bid for or purchase the item(s).  
 
5. The State of Arkansas Procurement Administrator shall decide any dispute, which is not disposed of by mutual agreement.  Bid offers 
less than the stated minimum bid amounts will not be considered.  Tie bids will be determined by a flip of a coin by Marketing & 
Redistribution staff.    
 
6. The State of Arkansas Procurement Administrator reserves the right to reject any or all bids, to waive any technical defects in bids; 
and unless otherwise specified by the State or the bidder, to accept any one item or group of items in the bid, as may be in the best interest 
of the State 
 
7.  It is the responsibility of each bidder to contact Marketing & Redistribution within 48 hours of the closing date and time of the bid to 
verify bid results and pay for the property.  Marketing & Redistribution must be contacted during normal working hours via phone, fax, in 
person or by email (with appropriate date and time stamp) is acceptable methods of contact and voice mail messages are not acceptable.  
Bidders will find the results posted after 1:00 p.m. the day of closing by going to the following link; 
www.arkansas.gov/dfa/procurement/mr/pro_mr.html and click on Bid Awards.  Persons listed are the winning bidders.  When bids close 
on Thursday, the 48 hour period will begin the next business day at 8:00 a.m.  The winning bidder will have 5 business days from date of 
payment to pick up the property.  Purchaser of property from the State of Arkansas may be subject to the payment of state sales and/or use 
tax.  Marketing & Redistribution is not responsible for collection of taxes for items titled for highway use. 
 
8. Failure to respond to three (3) consecutive “Invitations to Bid” and successful bidders that do not pay for and pick-up the item(s) 
awarded shall be considered sufficient cause to remove your name from the Bidder’s list. Additional penalties may be imposed if a bidder 
defaults more than one (1) time in a twelve-month period. Collusion or collaboration with another bidder or other bidders in the 
submission of a bid for the purpose of “rigging” (reducing) a bid shall be considered sufficient cause to remove all parties involved 
from the Bidder’s list for a period not to exceed three (3) years.  Contract default will not prevent purchases from retail sales.   
 
9. No changes may be made to the terminology of the official bid form or the general or special terms and conditions. 
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MINIMUM BID AMOUNT $35.00 

     
1. 100.00 Pots and Pans, Utensils, Large Bowls, 

Muffin Pans 
GM 90675412 

90675484 
90675488 
90675487 

     
2. 35.00 Candleholders, Serving Trays, Glasses, 

Cake Set, Salt and Pepper Shakers 
OTC 90662344 

     
3. 40.00 Plate Covers, Knives, Wine Glasses,  

Olive Oil Servers, Bowels 
OTC 90662348 

     
4. 150.00 Mixer, Kitchen Aid 

Property # GM50524, Serial # 72110110 
GM 90675414 

     
5. 139.01 Ice Machine, Ice Omatic ASC 90676053 
  Property # 1422, Serial # 1051-00171-W   
     
6. 41.00 Vacuum Cleaners and Steam Cleaners ADPT 90661742 

90654556 
90667210 
90675383 
90675384 
90651220 
90657271 

     
7. 36.00 Coffee Maker, Bunn 

Property # AGO6900, Serial # VPS0081241 
AG 90673223 

     
8. 59.75 Coffee Maker, Bunn  

Property# AG09881 Serial # VPS0123443 
AG 90671930 

     
9. 400.00 Mixer 5, Robot Coupe  DHS 90665824 
  Property # 210254039                             

Serial # 2400135813F-11 
  

     
10 38.00 Slicer/Can opener  DHS 90665824 

90673072 
     
11. Rejected Coffee Maker, Bunn OTC 90662373 
  Serial # 571845    
     
12. 50.00 Coffee Pot UMAS 90671663 
  Serial # VPR0466330   
     
13. 56.50 Vegetable Slicer, Quail Lein DHS 90665414 
  Property# D1119513 Serial # 95950D   
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                      MINIMUM BID AMOUNT $35.00 
 

  

     
14. 61.01 Meat Chopper/Grinder DHS 90665415 
  Property # D111951 Serial # 1208152   
     
15. 50.00 Food Storage Lids ASP 90665786 
  Plastic and Stainless Steel    
     
16. 150.00 Meat/Chopping Block  GM 90675407 
     
17. 101.00 Bakers Rack   90675415 
  Wicker Baskets (5)  90675446 

90675445 
90675444 
90675443 
90675454 

     
18. 50.00 Metal Cart  GM 90675416 
  Wicker Baskets  90675450 

90675448 
90675451 
90675447 
90675452 
90675449 
90675453 

     
19. 117.55 Showerheads, Low Flow 5 Boxes AEDC 90643050 
     
20. 305.00 Meat Slicer, Hobart DHS 90665427 
  Property # D133360 Serial # 56925979     
     
21. 111.55 Coffee Maker, Bunn-O-Matic Military 90652529 
  Property # 210215890 Serial # CRTF016650   
     
22. 205.00 Blenders, 2 DHS  
   Property # 210163290 Serial #559547  90655417 
   Property # 200026339 Serial #258523  90655416 
     
23. 61.25 Coffee Maker, Bunn AG 90671931 
   Property # AG08647 Serial #VPS0138649   
     
24. 75.00 Tea Containers (2), Bunn Coffee Maker GM 90675390 

90675489 
90675391 

     
25. 117.55 Coffee Maker, Bunn-O-Matic ARNG 90652528 
   Property # 210215889 Serial #CRTF016646   
     
26. 58.00 Food Mixer, Kitchen Aid ADPT 90666080 
   Property # 210051880   
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                     MINIMUM BID AMOUNT $35.00 
 

  

     
27. 105.00 Refrigerator, Jewett UAMS 90664773 
   Property #240178 Serial # 59588297   
     
28. 301.50 Refrigerator, Jewett UAMS 90664774 
   Property #240177 Serial # 595592297   
     
29. 75.00 Freezer, Revco UAMS 90671749 
   Serial # B30M597486BM   
     
30. 39.00 Freezer, Lab UAMS 90666212 
   Property #218749 Serial # 1086002   
     
31. 49.00 Freezer, Frigidaire, Stand up ADC 90672639 
   Serial # WB70446443   
     
32. 35.00 Freezer, Isotemp UAMS 90662601 
   Serial # 211N0541   
     
33. 40.00 Freezer, Isotemp UAMS 90674380 
   Serial # 308N0090   
     
34. 55.00 Freezer, Isotemp UAMS 90669277 
   Serial # WB33833640   
     
35. 125.01 Refrigerator, Frigidaire UCA 90672145 
   Property #N00006274 Serial #4A01507846   
     
36. 85.00 Refrigerator, GE UAMS 90671689 
   Serial #5Z269405   
     
37. NO BID Freezer, Chill, Chest ADC 90672963 
   Serial #892648   
     
38. NO BID Freezer, Montgomery Ward ADC 90672962 
   Serial #48J-09326   
     
39. 40.00 Freezer, Kenmore GM 90675367 
   Serial #2907010501F   
     
40. 69.50 Freezer, Jewett UAMS 90675297 
   Property # 221207 Serial #54437394   
     
41. 150.00 Freezer, Isotemp UAMS 90675287 
   Serial #50163798   
     
42. 45.95 Electric Range, Kenmore w/Microwave GE ADPT  
  Serial #ZR366191U  90670755 
   Property # 210084910 Serial #VF41037942  90674379 
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                  MINIMUM BID AMOUNT $ 35.00   
     
43. 169.00 Ice Machine, Follen UAMS 90675294 
     
44. 275.00 Range, US ADC 90672960 
   Serial #PS626-001   
     
45. 100.00 Convection Oven, Blodgett ADC 90672637 
   Property # 5835   
     
46. 61.10 Convection Oven, Cleveland Pro XVI UAMS 90659818 
   Property # 303960   
     
47. 179.50 Kitchen Grill w/Base, Garland ADC 90676876 
   Property # 56673 Serial #6T66606600003   
     
48. 100.00 Refrigerator, True ADC 90672638 
   Serial # 1-4109429   
     
49. 75.00 Freezer, Travisen UAMS 90660462 
   Serial # T783750AA00   
     
50. 65.00 Freezer, True 4 Door ADPT 90666056 
   Property # 200174647 Serial #1-4141069   

                          
 

51. NO BID Plate Warmer, Heritage ADPT 90658721 
   Property # 200101998 Serial #HB4STM   
     
52. 1500.00 Food Mixer w/Bowls, Hobart ADC 90676877 
   Property # 62730   
     
53. 50.95 Oven, Kenmore w/Microwve, Emerson  DFA  
   Serial #OV644425Q  90662228 
   Serial #00421157KG  90673221 
     
54. 40.00 Oven, Kenmore w/Microwave, Sunbeam ADPT  
   Property # 210106291 Serial #NF44214107  90670747 
   Property # 5540  90670214 
     
55. NO BID Diswashers, Lot of 2 

 
ADPT  

   Property # 210160313 Serial #FM724933B  90668287 
   Property # 210160313 Serial #FM724933B  90652789  
      
56. 37.01 Dryer, Commercial, Huebsch ADPT 90658717 
   Property #21005079 Serial 

#STCK9804023318 
  

     
57. 55.13 Washer, GE UAMS 90671790 
   Serial #DH106986G   
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                      MINIMUM BID AMOUNT $35.00 
 

  

     
58. NO BID Washer, Whirlpool GM 90675368 
   Property # GM50856 Serial #670814   
     
59. 155.00 Washer/Dryer, GE UAMS 90671763 
   Serial #HZ005329C   
     
60. 55.13 Dryer, GE UCA 90675938 
   Property # E32753   
     
61. Rejected Refrigerators, Lot of 2 UCA  
   Property # R13013  90675958 
   Serial #17W201004-27834  90647197 
     
62. 59.00 Water Fountains, Lot of 2 ADPT 90665412 
   Property # 210084909 Serial #09312077  90669294 
     
63. NO BID Electric Range, Kenmore w/Microwave, GE ADPT  
   Property # 5539 Serial #MT923614B  90670213 
   Property # 210084909 Serial #VF41037945  90670754 
     

 



 Page 1 
 
 MR-15-03 KITCHEN/RESTAURANT DATE OPEN: 8/28/2014 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 1 $100.00 * 
 
 4 JAMES TERRY 1 $67.50 
 
 28 TROY CHEATHAM 1 $51.83 
 
 23 BENNY REYNOLDS 1 $50.01 
 
 9 KENNETH ANDERSON 1 $45.00 
 
 2 RONALD BECKWITH 1 $43.00 
 
 13 JAMES GLOVER 1 $38.08 
 
 27 RONNIE LACKEY 1 $35.01 
 
 19 WILLIAM JOHNSON 1 $25.00 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 26 ALAN CURNETT 1 $15.50 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 2 $35.00 * 
 
 25 KAREGA WILSON 2 $25.00 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 19 WILLIAM JOHNSON 2 $20.01 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 15 JANICE CRIDER 2 $20.00 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 26 ALAN CURNETT 2 $10.00 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 3 $40.00 * 
 
 15 JANICE CRIDER 3 $30.00 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 25 KAREGA WILSON 3 $25.00 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 19 WILLIAM JOHNSON 3 $16.05 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 26 ALAN CURNETT 3 $12.50 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 4 $150.00 * 
 
 18 MARK FERGUSON 4 $67.50 
 
 2 RONALD BECKWITH 4 $47.00 



 
 15 JANICE CRIDER 4 $30.00 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 16 JOEL WALL 4 $26.55 Did not meet 
minimum 
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 MR-15-03 KITCHEN/RESTAURANT DATE OPEN: 8/28/2014 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 18 MARK FERGUSON 5 $139.01 * 
 
 9 KENNETH ANDERSON 5 $110.00 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 5 $67.50 
 
 29 JOE SMITH 5 $65.00 
 
 21 PAUL MADDOX 5 $48.50 
 
 27 RONNIE LACKEY 5 $40.00 
 
 13 JAMES GLOVER 5 $38.08 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 5 $36.50 
 
 28 TROY CHEATHAM 5 $35.13 
 
 19 WILLIAM JOHNSON 5 $20.05 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 25 KAREGA WILSON 5 $20.00 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 6 $41.00 * 
 
 26 ALAN CURNETT 6 $25.10 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 29 JOE SMITH 6 $25.00 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 7 $36.00 * 
 
 16 JOEL WALL 7 $27.55 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 21 PAUL MADDOX 8 $59.75 * 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 8 $40.00 
 
 16 JOEL WALL 8 $27.55 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 32 SCOTT MEISLOHN 9 $400.00 * 
 
 16 JOEL WALL 9 $127.55 
 
 2 RONALD BECKWITH 9 $65.00 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 9 $52.00 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 9 $51.50 
 



 15 JANICE CRIDER 9 $40.00 
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 MR-15-03 KITCHEN/RESTAURANT DATE OPEN: 8/28/2014 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 10 $38.00 * 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 10 $37.50 
 
 16 JOEL WALL 10 $27.55 Did not meet 
 mimumim 

 26 ALAN CURNETT 10 $7.25 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 11 $20.00 * Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 24 RICKEY A DAVIS 12 $50.00 * 
 
 21 PAUL MADDOX 12 $39.75 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 12 $35.00 
 
 26 ALAN CURNETT 12 $5.50 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 1 GLEN HENKE 13 $56.50 * 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 13 $40.00 

 
 23 BENNY REYNOLDS 14 $61.01 * 
 
 27 RONNIE LACKEY 14 $50.01 
 
 13 JAMES GLOVER 14 $38.08 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 14 $30.00 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 15 $50.00 * 
 
 9 KENNETH ANDERSON 15 $15.00 Did not meet mimum 



 Page 4 
 
 MR-15-03 KITCHEN/RESTAURANT DATE OPEN: 8/28/2014 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 16 $150.00 * 
 
 14 WILLIAM E BOOTH 16 $120.01 
 
 32 SCOTT MEISLOHN 16 $107.00 
 
 27 RONNIE LACKEY 16 $86.50 
 
 18 MARK FERGUSON 16 $79.99 
 
 2 RONALD BECKWITH 16 $65.00 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 16 $62.00 
 
 5 JEREMIAH RABON 16 $42.00 
 
 28 TROY CHEATHAM 16 $35.14 
 
 26 ALAN CURNETT 16 $10.50 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 1 GLEN HENKE 17 $101.00 * 
 
 3 ERNIE DODSON 17 $55.00 
 
 9 KENNETH ANDERSON 17 $35.00 
 
 19 WILLIAM JOHNSON 17 $25.07 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 26 ALAN CURNETT 17 $8.50 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 31 SUSIE COX 18 $50.00 * Winner 
 
 6 BRENDA ROSS 18 $50.00 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 18 $50.00 
 
 9 KENNETH ANDERSON 18 $50.00 
 
 2 RONALD BECKWITH 18 $47.00 
 
 24 RICKEY A DAVIS 18 $45.00 
 
 28 TROY CHEATHAM 18 $41.37 
 
 27 RONNIE LACKEY 18 $40.81 
 
 3 ERNIE DODSON 18 $40.00 
 
 19 WILLIAM JOHNSON 18 $35.00 
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 MR-15-03 KITCHEN/RESTAURANT DATE OPEN: 8/28/2014 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 16 JOEL WALL 19 $117.55 * 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 19 $66.00 
 
 24 RICKEY A DAVIS 19 $50.00 
 
 26 ALAN CURNETT 19 $25.50 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 20 $305.00 * 
 
 32 SCOTT MEISLOHN 20 $300.00 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 20 $111.00 
 
 16 JOEL WALL 20 $101.55 
 
 13 JAMES GLOVER 20 $38.08 

 
 16 JOEL WALL 21 $111.55 * 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 21 $50.00 

 
 32 SCOTT MEISLOHN 22 $205.00 * 
 
 2 RONALD BECKWITH 22 $67.00 
 
 16 JOEL WALL 22 $53.55 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 22 $35.00 

 
 21 PAUL MADDOX 23 $61.25 * 
 
 24 RICKEY A DAVIS 23 $50.00 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 23 $38.00 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 24 $75.00 * 
 
 7 JAMES E JONES 24 $50.00 
 
 25 KAREGA WILSON 24 $40.00 

 
 16 JOEL WALL 25 $117.55 * 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 25 $40.00 
 
 2 RONALD BECKWITH 25 $37.00 
 
 27 RONNIE LACKEY 25 $36.50 
 
 14 WILLIAM E BOOTH 25 $21.00 Did not meet 
minimum 
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 MR-15-03 KITCHEN/RESTAURANT DATE OPEN: 8/28/2014 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 26 $58.00 * 
 
 2 RONALD BECKWITH 26 $32.00 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 26 ALAN CURNETT 26 $7.50 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 32 SCOTT MEISLOHN 27 $105.00 * 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 27 $88.00 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 27 $38.00 

 
 18 MARK FERGUSON 28 $301.50 * 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 28 $111.00 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 28 $100.00 
 
 10 JIMMY EVANS 28 $51.99 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 29 $75.00 * 
 
 20 DANNY JORDON 29 $50.00 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 29 $39.00 

 
 1 GLEN HENKE 30 $39.00 * 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 30 $35.00 

 
 1 GLEN HENKE 31 $49.00 * 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 32 $35.00 * 

 
 32 SCOTT MEISLOHN 33 $40.00 * 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 33 $37.00 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 34 $55.00 * 
 
 32 SCOTT MEISLOHN 34 $40.00 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 34 $37.00 
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 MR-15-03 KITCHEN/RESTAURANT DATE OPEN: 8/28/2014 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 23 BENNY REYNOLDS 35 $125.01 * 
 
 29 JOE SMITH 35 $85.00 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 35 $60.00 
 
 8 ALI DROBATI 35 $50.50 
 
 20 DANNY JORDON 35 $50.00 
 
 12 FRED SAWYER 35 $40.00 
 
 19 WILLIAM JOHNSON 35 $25.05 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 29 JOE SMITH 36 $85.00 * 
 
 8 ALI DROBATI 36 $58.00 
 
 20 DANNY JORDON 36 $50.00 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 36 $35.00 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 39 $40.00 * 

 
 1 GLEN HENKE 40 $69.50 * 
 
 10 JIMMY EVANS 40 $56.66 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 40 $40.00 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 41 $150.00 * 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 41 $123.00 
 
 10 JIMMY EVANS 41 $36.51 

 
 20 DANNY JORDON 42 $45.95 * 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 42 $35.00 

 
 1 GLEN HENKE 43 $169.00 * 
 
 9 KENNETH ANDERSON 43 $127.50 
 
 29 JOE SMITH 43 $75.00 
 
 10 JIMMY EVANS 43 $49.99 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 43 $40.00 
 
 13 JAMES GLOVER 43 $38.08 
 



 28 TROY CHEATHAM 43 $35.13 
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 MR-15-03 KITCHEN/RESTAURANT DATE OPEN: 8/28/2014 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 44 $275.00 * 
 
 20 DANNY JORDON 44 $100.00 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 44 $69.00 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 45 $100.00 * 
 
 10 JIMMY EVANS 45 $36.99 

 
 10 JIMMY EVANS 46 $61.10 * 
 
 13 JAMES GLOVER 46 $38.08 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 46 $35.00 

 
 18 MARK FERGUSON 47 $179.50 * 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 47 $119.00 
 
 16 JOEL WALL 47 $101.55 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 47 $51.75 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 48 $100.00 * 
 
 13 JAMES GLOVER 48 $38.08 

 
 30 RAY LILLY 49 $75.00 * 
 
 13 JAMES GLOVER 49 $38.08 
 
 10 JIMMY EVANS 49 $37.75 

 
 1 GLEN HENKE 50 $65.00 * 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 50 $60.00 
 
 10 JIMMY EVANS 50 $38.51 
 
 13 JAMES GLOVER 50 $38.08 
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 MR-15-03 KITCHEN/RESTAURANT DATE OPEN: 8/28/2014 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 30 RAY LILLY 52 $1,500.00 * 
 
 32 SCOTT MEISLOHN 52 $1,100.00 
 
 16 JOEL WALL 52 $507.55 
 
 1 GLEN HENKE 52 $491.50 
 
 2 RONALD BECKWITH 52 $275.00 
 
 13 JAMES GLOVER 52 $51.06 

 
 20 DANNY JORDON 53 $50.95 * 

 
 11 HERMAN STEVENSON 54 $40.00 * 

 
 10 JIMMY EVANS 56 $37.01 * 

 
 22 BRIAN KINDALL 57 $55.13 * 

 
 29 JOE SMITH 59 $155.00 * 
 
 17 MARY KOON 59 $100.00 
 
 15 JANICE CRIDER 59 $100.00 
 
 19 WILLIAM JOHNSON 59 $80.05 
 
 20 DANNY JORDON 59 $75.95 
 
 27 RONNIE LACKEY 59 $52.50 

 
 22 BRIAN KINDALL 60 $55.13 * 
 
 25 KAREGA WILSON 60 $40.00 

 
 29 JOE SMITH 61 $25.00 * Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 1 GLEN HENKE 62 $59.00 * 
 
 13 JAMES GLOVER 62 $38.08 
 
 29 JOE SMITH 62 $25.00 Did not meet 
minimum 
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