
 

 
 
 

STATE OF ARKANSAS  OFFICE OF STATE PROCUREMENT
 Marketing and Redistribution 
Department of Finance 6620 Young Road 
 Little Rock, Arkansas 72209 
and Administration Phone:  (501) 565-8645   
 Fax: (501) 565-5059  
 http://www.state.ar.us/dfa
   

 
INVITATION TO BID 

 
BID NUMBER:    MR-15-13 
 
COMMODITY:   Shop/Miscellaneous   
  
LOCATION:   DFA – MARKETING & REDISTRIBUTION 
     6620 YOUNG ROAD 
     LITTLE ROCK, AR  72209 
 
INSPECTION DATES:  May 26, 27, 28, 29, 2015 and June 1, 2, 3, 2015 
                                           
      
INSPECTION HOURS:  8:00 AM – 3:00 PM 
 
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: June 4, 2015 @ 8:00 AM 

 
ITEMS LISTED ON THE ATTACHED SHEET (S) WILL BE SOLD TO THE HIGHEST BIDDER (S) SUBJECT TO 
ALL “GENERAL” AND IF APPLICABLE, “SPECIAL” TERMS AND CONDITIONS. 
 
BID FORMS MUST BE COMPLETED AND SIGNED TO BE CONSIDERED.  UNSIGNED BIDS OR LATE BIDS 

WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED. 
 
RESPONSE TO INVITATIONS TO BID MUST BE MAILED TO MARKETING & REDISTRIBUTION IN A 
SEALED ENVELOPE INDICATING THE BID NUMBER AND DATE OF THE BID OPENING ON THE OUTSIDE 
OF THE ENVELOPE OR MAY BE HAND CARRIED TO THE MARKETING & REDISTRIBUTION OFFICE. 
RESPONSES MUST BE RECEIVED PRIOR TO THE TIME AND DATE INDICATED ON THE DOCUMENT FOR 
THE BID OPENING IN ORDER TO BE CONSIDERED. 
 
AT THE TIME INDICATED FOR THE BID OPENING ALL BIDS WILL BE PUBLICLY READ AND TABULATED.  
BIDDERS MUST CONTACT MARKETING & REDISTRIBUTION WITHIN 48 HOURS OF THE CLOSING DATE 
AND TIME TO VERIFY BID RESULTS AND PAY FOR PROPERTY.   SUCCESSFUL BIDDERS MUST REMOVE 
AWARDED ITEMS WITHIN FIVE (5) BUSINESS DAYS FROM DATE OF PAYMENT. 
          _____________________  

Please Legibly PRINT all required information (For office use only)

 
YOUR SIGNATURE INDICATES THAT YOU AGREE TO ALL TERMS & CONDITIONS OF THIS SALE 

 
SIGNATURE:             
 
PRINTED NAME:             
 
COMPANY NAME:             
 
ADDRESS:              
        CITY  STATE  ZIP 
BUSINESS PHONE:       HOME PHONE:       
 
CELLULAR PHONE:      FAX NUMBER:       
 

EMAIL ADDRESS:             
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GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
========================================================================= 
1. Bidder is invited, urged & cautioned to inspect property to be sold prior to submitting a bid.  Property will be available for inspection 
at the place and times specified in the invitation.  All property is offered for sale “as is, where is”.  The State makes no warranty, 
expressed or implied as to quality, kind, character, quantity, weight, size or description of any of the property or its fitness for any use or 
purpose.  Any oral statement or representation by any representative of the State is unauthorized and shall confer no right upon the Bidder 
or Purchaser. 
 
2. The purchaser agrees to pay for item(s) awarded to him in accordance with the prices offered in his bid.  All forms of payment must be 
in US currency.  Payment is to be made in the form of cash, check, and postal money order, Visa, Discover or Master Card  Checks must 
be made payable to Marketing & Redistribution.  If payment is made in the form of a check and the financial institution does not honor it a 
$25.00 service fee will be charged and a personal check will not be accepted for up to a one-year period.  
 
3. Unless otherwise specified in the invitation, the purchaser shall be entitled to obtain the property upon vesting of title or the receipt of 
payment for the property.  The purchaser shall be responsible for the loading and removal of property, at his expense.  Marketing & 
Redistribution employees will assist with loading heavy or large items at Marketing & Redistribution as time permits.  In no way will the 
State suffer any expense, penalty, personal or property liability in the removal of said equipment.  Marketing & Redistribution reserves the 
right to cancel a bid and re-bid the property when procedures are not complied with.  
 
4. When bids are signed or when bids are made available via the web site and are submitted via the web, this constitutes a contract with 
the State of Arkansas to pay the amount(s) indicated for the equipment offered for sale.  Failure to comply could result in action being 
taken by the Attorney General’s office and/or be cause for rejection of future bids.  Unsigned bids will not be read or considered.  By 
signing the Invitation for Bid document or by submitting a bid via the web the Bidder warrants that they are not less than eighteen years of 
age.  As mandated in ACA § 19-11-242, Employees of the State of Arkansas Department of Finance and Administration or members of 
their immediate family may not bid.  When an “On Location” sale takes place employees and family members of the agency selling the 
goods may not bid for or purchase the item(s).  
 
5. The State of Arkansas Procurement Administrator shall decide any dispute, which is not disposed of by mutual agreement.  Bid offers 
less than the stated minimum bid amounts will not be considered.  Tie bids will be determined by a flip of a coin by Marketing & 
Redistribution staff.    
 
6. The State of Arkansas Procurement Administrator reserves the right to reject any or all bids, to waive any technical defects in bids; 
and unless otherwise specified by the State or the bidder, to accept any one item or group of items in the bid, as may be in the best interest 
of the State 
 
7.  It is the responsibility of each bidder to contact Marketing & Redistribution within 48 hours of the closing date and time of the bid to 
verify bid results and pay for the property.  Marketing & Redistribution must be contacted during normal working hours via phone, fax, in 
person or by email (with appropriate date and time stamp) is acceptable methods of contact and voice mail messages are not acceptable.  
Bidders will find the results posted after 1:00 p.m. the day of closing by going to the following link; 
www.arkansas.gov/dfa/procurement/mr/pro_mr.html and click on Bid Awards.  Persons listed are the winning bidders.  When bids close 
on Thursday, the 48 hour period will begin the next business day at 8:00 a.m.  The winning bidder will have 5 business days from date of 
payment to pick up the property.  Purchaser of property from the State of Arkansas may be subject to the payment of state sales and/or use 
tax.  Marketing & Redistribution is not responsible for collection of taxes for items titled for highway use. 
 
8. Failure to respond to three (3) consecutive “Invitations to Bid” and successful bidders that do not pay for and pick-up the item(s) 
awarded shall be considered sufficient cause to remove your name from the Bidder’s list. Additional penalties may be imposed if a bidder 
defaults more than one (1) time in a twelve-month period. Collusion or collaboration with another bidder or other bidders in the 
submission of a bid for the purpose of “rigging” (reducing) a bid shall be considered sufficient cause to remove all parties involved 
from the Bidder’s list for a period not to exceed three (3) years.  Contract default will not prevent purchases from retail sales.   
 
9. No changes may be made to the terminology of the official bid form or the general or special terms and conditions. 
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MINIMUM BID AMOUNT $50.00 

     
1. 60.00 Floor Jack, 3 Ton ADPT 90716637 
  Shop Press, 12Ton DIS 90718551 
     
     
2. 60.00 Generator, 4000 Watt Gas AFGC 90697627 
     
     
3. 125.15 Shop Fan, Red ADEM 90711934 
     
     
4. 100.00 Welder, Lincoln Electric 225 OTC 90696850 
     
     
5. 301.60 Ban Saw, Wilson ASP 90702007 
     
     
6. 179.77 Welder, Electric Miller NPCC 90690657 
  Mask, Welding ADPT 90716304 
     
     
7. 157.57 Tool Box, 14 Drawer MAC UA 90697848 
     
     
8. 58.00 Paint Sprayer, Electric  ADPT 90693202 
     
     
9. 135.55 Tool Box, 14 Drawer MAC            UA 90697841 
     
     
10 100.75 Pressure Washer, Gas 2400 PSI            ADPT 90693203 
     
     
11. 107.71 Tool Box, 14 Drawer MAC UA 90697841 
     
     
12. 129.50 Heater, 35000 BTU ADED 90642728 
  Siding Kit, Vinyl ADED 90705818 
  Blower ADED 90705819 
     
     
13. 129.50 Heater, 35000 BTU ADED 90642729 
  Blower ADED 90705822 
     
     
14. 892.99 Insulation Blower  ADED 90642367 
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                     MINIMUM BID AMOUNT $50.00 

 
  

15. 75.00 Carpet Cleaner, Hoover ADPT 90690388 
  Vacuum, Hoover  ADPT 90690390 
  Vacuum, Eureka ADPT 90682575 
  Vacuum, Hoover ADPT 90693820 
  Vacuum, Kent Powerhouse ASU 90696068 
  Vacuum Belts (37) ASU 90704522 
  Vacuum Bags (11) ASU 90704436 
  Vacuum Belts (48) ASU 90704558 
  Box of Misc. Vacuum Parts ADPT 90690401 
  Box of Buffing Pads ASU 90708547 
  Vacuum Belts (15) ASU 90704629 
  Vacuum Bags (16) ASU 90704447 
  Vacuum Filters (15) ASU 90704654 
  Box of Vacuum Bags ASU 90712593 
     
     
16. 289.01 Panel Heater (12) UCA 90712858 
     
     
17. 289.01 Generator, Gas 10,000 Watt ASU 90695786 
  Paint Sprayer, Airless ADPT 90698447 
     
     
18. 79.00 Weight, 1000lb Iron ALPC 90717342 
     
     
19. 60.00 Shop Press ADPT 90698584 
     
     
20. 299.89 Band Saw, Radial Arm ASP 90702006 
     
     
21. 60.00 Engine Stand Base   OTC 90696871 
     
     
22. 52.00 Upholstery Machine  ASU 90703127 
     
     
23. 111.00 Scale, Russell ALPC 90717334 
     
     
24. 275.90 Tire Machine, Hoffman ASP 90701997 
     
     
25. 229.01 Freight Loader REV 90703608 
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                  MINIMUM BID AMOUNT $ 50.00   
     
26. NO BID Shipping Crate DFA 90708571 
     
     
27. 120.13 Paint, 5 Gal Interior (10) ACC 90709051 
  Paint, 1 Gal Interior (4) ACC 90709041 
  Paint, 1 Gal interior (2) ABA 90675580 
  Air Seal, Bucket DFA 90710644 
  Air Seal, Case DFA 90710663 
  Air Seal, Case DFA 90710662 
  Paint, 5 Gal Interior ABA 90675578 
     
     
28. 50.17 Box of Filters (Misc.) ADCC 90700974 
  Box of Belts (Misc.) ADC 90638352 
  Box of Belts and Filters (Misc.) ADPT 90715743 
  Misfire Auditor UA 90657712 
  Clutch Flywheel ASP 90701735 
  Spark Plugs (32) ASP 90701845 
  Spotlight Bulbs (3) ASP 90701889 
  Brake Pads (22) ASP 90701705 
  Brake Rotors (9) ASP 90701839 
     
     
29. 73.02 Gaskets ASP 90701748 
  Strapping Kit ADPT 90716305 
  Oil Filters (Misc.) ADCC 90700996 
  Wheel Bearings ADCC 90700694 
  Belts (112) ADCC 90701249 
  Fuel Filters (10) ASP 90701736 
  Air Filters (19) ASP 90701661 
  Box of Misc. Tool ADCC 90701016 
  Brake Pads (4) ASP 90701703 
  Brake Rotors (4) ASP 90701838 
  Wiper Blades (2) ASP 90701488 
  Gaskets ASP 90701747 
     
     
30. 80.00 Paint Gun, Electric ADPT 90715891 
  Booster Pack, 12V ASU 90710213 
  Reciprocating Saw ADPT 90712899 
  Safety Harness APDT 90716329 
  Hydraulic Cylinder ADPT 90716301 
  Reciprocating Saw, Battery Powered ADPT 90715890 
  Trailer Tongue ADPT 90716306 
  Nail Gun ADPT 90715915 
  Drill, Cordless UCA 90713158 
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                  MINIMUM BID AMOUNT $ 50.00   
     
31. 100.00 Vacuum, Shop AHTD 90714126 
  Fan, Small Shop ADH 90715772 
  Air Compressor, 26 Gal ASP 90702002 
     
     
32. 200.13 Driver, Gas AGFC 90706785 
     
     
33. 231.99 Sewing Machine, Speedwelt ADC 90699238 
     
     
34. 79.00 Sewing Machine, Juki ADC 90699236 
     
     
35. 54.99 Pocket Press ADC 90699239 
     
     
36. 67.55 Pocket Creaser  ADC 90699240 
     
     
37. 51.01 Sewing Machine, Reece ADC 90699237 
     
     
38. 55.00 Sewing Machine, Singer ASU 90704833 
     
     
39. 50.00 Sewing Machine, Singer ASU 90707303 
     
     
40. 129.00 Sewing Machine, Juki ADC 90699242 
     
     
41. 119.50 Sewing Machine, Singer ADC 90699246 

 
     
42. 200.00 Sewing Machine, Juki ADC 90699247 
     
     
43. 50.00 Sewing Machine, Singer  ASU 90704831 
     
     
44. 100.00 Sewing Machine, Singer ASU 90704832 
     
     
45. NO BID Piano  DHS 90697314 
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                  MINIMUM BID AMOUNT $ 50.00   
     
46. NO BID Piano  DHS 90716023 
     
     
47. 70.00 Organ DHS 90705793 
     
     
48. NO BID Piano               ASU 90710537 
     
     
49. NO BID Piano With Bench  ASU 90681180 
     
     
50. 70.00 Organ  UCA 90703985 

 
     
51. NO BID Piano DHS 90697315 
     
     
52. 125.00 Piano UALR 90705303 
     
     
53. 79.50 Sewing Machine, Juki ADC 90699248 
     
     
54. 75.50 Piano UALR 90705306 
     
     
55. NO BID Piano  UALR 90705304 
     
     
56. 251.10 Piano UALR 90705305 
     
     
57. 151.00 A/C Window Units (2) ADEM 90711932 
  A/C Window Unit AGFC 90713207 
     
     
58. 126.26 Compressor ASU 90704264 
     
     
59. 127.77 Shelving, Metal ADOL 90716379 
     
     
60. 51.50 Garage Door AHTD 90715868 
     
     
     
     
                  MINIMUM BID AMOUNT $ 50.00   
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61. NO BID Tool Carts (6)  REV 90703027 
     
     
62. 67.00 Welding Station, 2 Part ASU 90710400 
     
     
63. 52.02 Shelving Units, Metal (3) UAMS 90719239 
     
     
64. 52.02 Shelving Units, Metal (3) UAMS 90719246 
     
     
65. 57.57 Shelving Units, Metal (3) UAMS 90719235 
     

 



 Page 1 
 
 MR-15-13 SHOP/MISC. DATE OPEN: 6/4/2015 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 1 $60.00 * 
 
 13 FRED BUZEN JR. 1 $51.00 
 
 50 SHAWN TUCKER 1 $51.00 

 
 51 JB ALSTON 2 $60.00 * 

 
 17 GLAYTON JOHNSON 3 $125.15 * 
 
 23 MARK FERGUSON 3 $121.50 
 
 32 RED BIRD TOWING 3 $100.50 
 
 42 JASON SPARKS 3 $95.01 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 3 $76.01 
 
 49 ASHLEY NORRIS 3 $75.00 
 
 1 LEE WILLIAMS 3 $75.00 
 
 10 WAYNE COLLINS 3 $70.00 
 
 30 DAVID KOON 3 $66.00 
 
 13 FRED BUZEN JR. 3 $65.00 
 
 11 DAVID WARD 3 $55.00 
 
 21 HENSLEY FIRE DEPARTMENT 3 $52.00 
 
 37 SMITH'S DISCOUNT 3 $52.00 
 
 31 BOBBY HALL 3 $51.20 
 
 5 JAMES MOORE 3 $51.03 
 
 35 JOHN PEEPELS 3 $50.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 3 $50.00 
 
 2 JOHN MARBLE 3 $45.00 
 
 44 MELTON MORROW 3 $15.00 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 19 KEITH GRACIE 4 $100.00 * 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 4 $55.00 
 
 11 DAVID WARD 4 $50.00 
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 MR-15-13 SHOP/MISC. DATE OPEN: 6/4/2015 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 23 MARK FERGUSON 5 $301.60 * 
 
 22 RHETT WILSON 5 $277.77 
 
 29 EL JACOBS 5 $219.75 
 
 24 FELTON LAMB 5 $199.89 
 
 28 JOE SMITH 5 $175.90 
 
 10 WAYNE COLLINS 5 $135.50 
 
 18 JEFF ROBERTS 5 $125.99 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 5 $111.00 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 5 $101.00 
 
 21 HENSLEY FIRE DEPARTMENT 5 $100.00 
 
 8 CENTRAL ARKANSAS 5 $77.77 
 ELECTRONICS 

 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 5 $75.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 5 $55.00 
 
 35 JOHN PEEPELS 5 $50.00 

 
 24 FELTON LAMB 6 $179.77 * 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 6 $89.00 
 
 18 JEFF ROBERTS 6 $75.99 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 6 $75.00 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 6 $55.00 
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 MR-15-13 SHOP/MISC. DATE OPEN: 6/4/2015 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 39 STUFF 2 SALE 7 $157.57 * 
 
 42 JASON SPARKS 7 $86.04 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 7 $75.01 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 7 $75.00 
 
 37 SMITH'S DISCOUNT 7 $75.00 
 
 23 MARK FERGUSON 7 $67.50 
 
 18 JEFF ROBERTS 7 $65.99 
 
 9 LAMAR FAUGHT 7 $59.00 
 
 8 CENTRAL ARKANSAS 7 $57.57 
 ELECTRONICS 

 5 JAMES MOORE 7 $55.03 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 7 $55.00 
 
 35 JOHN PEEPELS 7 $50.00 

 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 8 $58.00 * 
 
 25 JUM INVESTMENTS 8 $56.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 8 $50.00 
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 MR-15-13 SHOP/MISC. DATE OPEN: 6/4/2015 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 10 WAYNE COLLINS 9 $135.55 * 
 
 39 STUFF 2 SALE 9 $107.77 
 
 42 JASON SPARKS 9 $86.04 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 9 $75.01 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 9 $75.00 
 
 7 H AND H COMPUTER 9 $75.00 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 9 $75.00 
 
 37 SMITH'S DISCOUNT 9 $75.00 
 
 18 JEFF ROBERTS 9 $73.99 
 
 29 EL JACOBS 9 $67.50 
 
 8 CENTRAL ARKANSAS 9 $57.57 
 ELECTRONICS 

 50 SHAWN TUCKER 9 $55.55 
 
 5 JAMES MOORE 9 $55.03 
 
 31 BOBBY HALL 9 $51.20 
 
 35 JOHN PEEPELS 9 $50.00 
 
 32 RED BIRD TOWING 9 $41.50 Did not meet 
minimum 
 
 44 MELTON MORROW 9 $25.00 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 32 RED BIRD TOWING 10 $100.75 * 
 
 17 GLAYTON JOHNSON 10 $75.17 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 10 $70.00 
 
 31 BOBBY HALL 10 $51.20 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 10 $51.00 
 
 25 JUM INVESTMENTS 10 $51.00 
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 MR-15-13 SHOP/MISC. DATE OPEN: 6/4/2015 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 39 STUFF 2 SALE 11 $107.71 * 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 11 $100.00 
 
 40 WAYNE LEWIS 11 $89.00 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 11 $75.01 
 
 37 SMITH'S DISCOUNT 11 $75.00 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 11 $75.00 
 
 18 JEFF ROBERTS 11 $73.99 
 
 8 CENTRAL ARKANSAS 11 $57.57 
 ELECTRONICS 

 5 JAMES MOORE 11 $55.03 
 
 42 JASON SPARKS 11 $51.02 
 
 2 JOHN MARBLE 11 $50.00 

 
 23 MARK FERGUSON 12 $129.50 * 
 
 40 WAYNE LEWIS 12 $99.50 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 12 $57.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 12 $55.00 
 
 39 STUFF 2 SALE 12 $53.55 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 12 $51.00 

 
 23 MARK FERGUSON 13 $129.50 * 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 13 $101.00 
 
 40 WAYNE LEWIS 13 $99.50 
 
 39 STUFF 2 SALE 13 $57.55 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 13 $55.00 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 13 $51.00 
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 MR-15-13 SHOP/MISC. DATE OPEN: 6/4/2015 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 23 MARK FERGUSON 14 $892.99 * 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 14 $701.00 
 
 39 STUFF 2 SALE 14 $567.55 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 14 $400.00 
 
 26 KENNERH CUSTER 14 $355.99 
 
 44 MELTON MORROW 14 $325.00 
 
 28 JOE SMITH 14 $175.90 
 
 47 BRYAN TEMPLES 14 $165.33 
 
 16 TERRY GILL 14 $150.00 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 14 $111.00 
 
 1 LEE WILLIAMS 14 $100.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 14 $100.00 
 
 24 FELTON LAMB 14 $59.99 
 
 25 JUM INVESTMENTS 14 $50.00 

 
 51 JB ALSTON 15 $75.00 * 
 
 21 HENSLEY FIRE DEPARTMENT 15 $55.00 
 
 42 JASON SPARKS 15 $54.15 

 
 23 MARK FERGUSON 16 $289.01 * 
 
 40 WAYNE LEWIS 16 $150.00 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 16 $111.00 
 
 39 STUFF 2 SALE 16 $107.57 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 16 $75.01 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 16 $75.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 16 $55.00 
 
 47 BRYAN TEMPLES 16 $51.22 
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 MR-15-13 SHOP/MISC. DATE OPEN: 6/4/2015 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 23 MARK FERGUSON 17 $289.01 * 
 
 42 JASON SPARKS 17 $285.17 
 
 15 FREDRICK WILISON 17 $250.00 
 
 16 TERRY GILL 17 $200.00 
 
 21 HENSLEY FIRE DEPARTMENT 17 $200.00 
 
 46 BOB CURTLY 17 $157.00 
 
 8 CENTRAL ARKANSAS 17 $152.52 
 ELECTRONICS 

 37 SMITH'S DISCOUNT 17 $150.00 
 
 38 H R PERKINS 17 $125.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 17 $120.00 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 17 $100.00 
 
 11 DAVID WARD 17 $100.00 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 17 $81.00 
 
 7 H AND H COMPUTER 17 $75.00 
 
 25 JUM INVESTMENTS 17 $66.00 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 17 $57.00 
 
 50 SHAWN TUCKER 17 $51.51 
 
 6 ELSIE LEE WILLIAMS 17 $50.00 

 
 41 GLENN HENKE 18 $79.00 * 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 18 $61.00 
 
 47 BRYAN TEMPLES 18 $56.22 
 
 34 JIMMY EVANS 18 $55.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 18 $.00 

 
 51 JB ALSTON 19 $60.00 * 
 
 8 CENTRAL ARKANSAS 19 $55.75 
 ELECTRONICS 
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 MR-15-13 SHOP/MISC. DATE OPEN: 6/4/2015 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 24 FELTON LAMB 20 $299.89 * 
 
 28 JOE SMITH 20 $175.90 
 
 50 SHAWN TUCKER 20 $75.62 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 20 $70.00 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 20 $51.00 

 
 51 JB ALSTON 21 $60.00 * 
 
 13 FRED BUZEN JR. 21 $55.00 

 
 14 BILL BOLIN 22 $52.00 * 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 22 $51.01 

 
 41 GLENN HENKE 23 $111.00 * 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 23 $55.00 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 23 $51.00 

 
 28 JOE SMITH 24 $275.90 * 
 
 43 BARRON KINDLE 24 $235.99 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 24 $211.00 
 
 26 KENNERH CUSTER 24 $201.99 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 24 $151.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 24 $150.00 
 
 50 SHAWN TUCKER 24 $73.00 

 
 23 MARK FERGUSON 25 $229.01 * 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 25 $211.00 
 
 16 TERRY GILL 25 $205.00 
 
 3 PIANO KARFT 25 $200.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 25 $100.00 
 
 47 BRYAN TEMPLES 25 $95.33 
 
 34 JIMMY EVANS 25 $60.01 
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 MR-15-13 SHOP/MISC. DATE OPEN: 6/4/2015 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 17 GLAYTON JOHNSON 27 $120.13 * 
 
 1 LEE WILLIAMS 27 $55.00 
 
 31 BOBBY HALL 27 $51.20 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 27 $51.00 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 27 $50.00 
 
 45 G HIGH TECH 27 $11.00 Did not meet 
minimum 

 
 42 JASON SPARKS 28 $50.17 * 
 
 35 JOHN PEEPELS 28 $50.00 

 
 5 JAMES MOORE 29 $73.02 * 
 
 23 MARK FERGUSON 29 $62.50 
 
 35 JOHN PEEPELS 29 $50.00 

 
 51 JB ALSTON 30 $80.00 * 
 
 9 LAMAR FAUGHT 30 $79.00 
 
 25 JUM INVESTMENTS 30 $71.00 
 
 23 MARK FERGUSON 30 $62.50 
 
 6 ELSIE LEE WILLIAMS 30 $50.00 

 
 51 JB ALSTON 31 $100.00 * 
 
 21 HENSLEY FIRE DEPARTMENT 31 $55.00 

 
 17 GLAYTON JOHNSON 32 $200.13 * 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 32 $129.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 32 $100.00 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 32 $70.01 
 
 37 SMITH'S DISCOUNT 32 $56.00 
 
 26 KENNERH CUSTER 32 $51.01 
 
 44 MELTON MORROW 32 $20.00 Did not meet 
minimum 
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 MR-15-13 SHOP/MISC. DATE OPEN: 6/4/2015 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 26 KENNERH CUSTER 33 $231.99 * 
 
 47 BRYAN TEMPLES 33 $101.55 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 33 $79.00 
 
 39 STUFF 2 SALE 33 $57.55 

 
 41 GLENN HENKE 34 $79.00 * 
 
 47 BRYAN TEMPLES 34 $76.22 

 
 26 KENNERH CUSTER 35 $54.99 * 

 
 39 STUFF 2 SALE 36 $67.55 * 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 36 $55.00 
 
 26 KENNERH CUSTER 36 $50.01 

 
 26 KENNERH CUSTER 37 $51.01 * 

 
 7 H AND H COMPUTER 38 $55.00 * 
 
 27 KEVYN FOWLER 38 $50.00 

 
 27 KEVYN FOWLER 39 $50.00 * 

 
 41 GLENN HENKE 40 $129.00 * 
 
 26 KENNERH CUSTER 40 $87.99 
 
 27 KEVYN FOWLER 40 $50.00 

 
 29 EL JACOBS 41 $119.50 * 
 
 27 KEVYN FOWLER 41 $50.00 

 
 27 KEVYN FOWLER 42 $200.00 * 
 
 47 BRYAN TEMPLES 42 $76.22 

 
 27 KEVYN FOWLER 43 $50.00 * 

 
 27 KEVYN FOWLER 44 $100.00 * 

 
 6 ELSIE LEE WILLIAMS 47 $70.00 * 



 Page 11 
 
 MR-15-13 SHOP/MISC. DATE OPEN: 6/4/2015 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 6 ELSIE LEE WILLIAMS 50 $70.00 * 

 
 3 PIANO KARFT 52 $125.00 * 

 
 47 BRYAN TEMPLES 53 $79.50 * 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 53 $77.00 
 
 27 KEVYN FOWLER 53 $50.00 

 
 32 RED BIRD TOWING 54 $75.50 * 

 
 33 BENNY REYNOLDS 56 $251.10 * 
 
 16 TERRY GILL 56 $150.00 

 
 48 SAVOY WILEY 57 $151.00 * 
 
 4 BEVERLY DICKSON 57 $81.00 
 
 36 RONNIE LACKEY 57 $75.01 
 
 37 SMITH'S DISCOUNT 57 $65.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 57 $55.00 
 
 34 JIMMY EVANS 57 $53.00 
 
 5 JAMES MOORE 57 $50.03 

 
 34 JIMMY EVANS 58 $126.26 * 
 
 41 GLENN HENKE 58 $111.00 
 
 16 TERRY GILL 58 $100.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 58 $55.00 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 58 $51.00 

 
 8 CENTRAL ARKANSAS 59 $127.77 * 
 ELECTRONICS 

 20 BILL CARSON 59 $111.11 
 
 13 FRED BUZEN JR. 59 $101.00 
 
 38 H R PERKINS 59 $62.00 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 59 $51.00 
 
 45 G HIGH TECH 59 $26.00 Did not meet 



minimum 
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 MR-15-13 SHOP/MISC. DATE OPEN: 6/4/2015 

 
 BID ID VENDOR BID$ HIGH BID 
 ITEM 
 
 8 CENTRAL ARKANSAS 60 $51.50 * 
 ELECTRONICS 

 11 DAVID WARD 60 $50.00 
 
 51 JB ALSTON 60 $50.00 

 
 41 GLENN HENKE 62 $67.00 * 
 
 34 JIMMY EVANS 62 $55.00 
 
 12 DEWIGHT RILEY 62 $51.00 

 
 20 BILL CARSON 63 $52.02 * 
 
 13 FRED BUZEN JR. 63 $51.00 

 
 20 BILL CARSON 64 $52.02 * 
 
 13 FRED BUZEN JR. 64 $51.00 

 
 8 CENTRAL ARKANSAS 65 $57.57 * 
 ELECTRONICS 

 20 BILL CARSON 65 $52.02 
 
 13 FRED BUZEN JR. 65 $51.00 
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